Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, July 15, 2022 6:29 PM
To: Admin A; Admin-B
Subject: FW: NEW TP DS claim:
Internal
PW: Allianz1

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore)
Sent: Friday, July 15, 2022 6:28 PM

To: nitha@mova.com.sg

Cc: admin-a@lkkauto.com; admin-b@Ilkkauto.com
Subject: NEW TP DS claim:

Internal

Your ref: SKB7431C
Our ref: SVRAISCL2022-00035KC-XD5356K

Dear Sirs,

We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them and to arrange for survey.

Please download the documents from this link below (For Survey)

File: RPT.pdf, Estimate Report.pdf

Link: https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=766bda65-0784-4254-af1a-ab36471ca0f6-
82ab9c172aa50efb

Size: ~ 1 MByte, Download available until: 7/22/2022

Passwords will be sent in a separate email.

Thank you.

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897
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This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.
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From: Nitha <nitha@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, July 15, 2022 2:15 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Cc: 'Brian' <brian.eng@mova.com.sg>; 'Enny' <enny@mova.com.sg>
Subject: [EXT] TP CLAIMS - SKB7431C AGAINST XD5356K DOA 08/07/2022

Dear All
Kindly assign surveyor to survey the above-mentioned vehicle at 15 Fan Yoong Road.

Thank you,
Best Regards,

Nuthha
Claims Officer

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd
Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314
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Automolive Ple Ltd



