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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 8 September 2022 9:21 AM
To: Wah Hong motors & credit pte ltd
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: LOD & INV : OUR REF WH1308 SMH6445P & SKS8667T DOA 12/07/2022 Our 

Ref: Our Ref: 22/22/22/VP05/026028
Attachments: GIRO AUTHORISATION FORM.PDF; DV_SMH6445P.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Jenny, 
 
As per our tele-conversation yesterday, we confirmed settlement as follows: - 
 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 12,619.05 
2. Loss of Use $      540.00 
3. Insurance Search Fee $          2.00 

Total $ 13,161.05 
 
Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
 
LONPAC is targeting to process all payments via e-payments. Hence, please complete and return the attached GIRO 
Form to enable LONPAC to process their payment. 
 
Thank you. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Wah Hong motors & credit pte ltd <motor@wahhong.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 7 September 2022 12:24 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
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Subject: Re: LOD & INV : OUR REF WH1308 SMH6445P & SKS8667T DOA 12/07/2022 Our Ref: Our Ref: 
22/22/22/VP05/026028 
 

Hi Hsiao Tong 

Wah Hong is dealing with direct settlement, please amend global sum to breakdown sum. 

Thank you 

On 7/9/2022 11:55 am, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) wrote: 

Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/mdm, 
  
We are prepared to revise our offer at a global sum of $13,160.00(all-in). 
  
Please confirm acceptance. 
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole 
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, 
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially 
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation 
terms/settlement.” 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  

From: Wah Hong motors & credit pte ltd <motor@wahhong.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 25 August 2022 11:27 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: LOD & INV : OUR REF WH1308 SMH6445P & SKS8667T DOA 12/07/2022 Our Ref: Our 
Ref: 22/22/22/VP05/026028 
  

Hi  

Please adjust the LOU to $640.00 due to 7 seater vehicle. 

On 25/8/2022 9:45 am, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) wrote: 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
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  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
  
Dear Sirs, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We propose settlement as follows: - 
  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 12,619.05 
2. Loss of Use (8days x $60.00) $     480.00 
3. Insurance Search Fee $         2.00 

Total $ 13,101.05 
  
Please confirm acceptance. 
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice 
basis with the sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal 
proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will 
materially affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, 
by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Monday, 8 August 2022 10:39 AM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
<chewht@lkkauto.com>; Wah Hong motors & credit pte ltd <motor@wahhong.sg> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: FW: LOD & INV : OUR REF WH1308 SMH6445P & SKS8667T DOA 
12/07/2022 Our Ref: Our Ref: 22/22/22/VP05/026028 
  

Lonpac External - General 
  
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Jenny 
  
Please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd. 
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Dear Mei Kwan/Hsiao Tong 
  
FYA 
  
Regards, 
Ong Li Li 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road #17-04/06 The Concourse  
Singapore 199555 
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
  
  
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not 
condone bribery, fraud or corrupt practices. 

From: Wah Hong motors & credit pte ltd <motor@wahhong.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 5 August 2022 3:50 pm 
To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: LOD & INV : OUR REF WH1308 SMH6445P & SKS8667T DOA 12/07/2022 
  

Hi 

Attached is the LOD & Invoices for your perusal. 
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