Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: sam Gui <samgui@project8.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 26 October 2022 7:09 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: FBP 79877

Hi,

We're claiming for LOU on behalf of our client.
We're claiming $40 X 5 days.

Regards,

Sam Gui

Director

+65 8363 3050

61 Woodlands Industrial Park E9, E9 Premium #01-03
Singapore 757047
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---- On Thu, 20 Oct 2022 09:50:59 +0800 Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental receipt) to
us (LKK) for our necessary action.

Please note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval.



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: sam Gui <samgui@project8.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 18 October 2022 4:38 pm
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: FBP 79877

Hi,
Cost of repair accepted.
Regards,

Sam Gui

Director

+65 8363 3050

61 Woodlands Industrial Park E9, E9 Premium #01-03
Singapore 757047
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---- On Tue, 18 Oct 2022 09:29:47 +0800 Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote ---

Hi Sam,

Kindly acknowledge

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth: Frint only wher necessary-

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 17 October 2022 9:38 am
To: sam Gui <samgui@project8.sg>
Subject: FBP 79872

Hi Sam,

Refer to attachment

Audit checked parts prices slightly high required to be adjusted.

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $1,500.00 /- with 05 days of
repair subject to their approval.

Kindly acknowledge



Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth- Print only when necessary-



