Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Genevieve Kua (ECICS, Claims) <Genevieve_Kua@ecics.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 13 July 2022 10:10 AM

To: Juan Paulo Bongon Baldoz

Cc: Liu Chun Cheong (ECICS, Operations / Claims); sur@lkkauto.com;
assignments@lkkauto.com

Subject: RE: [PRI] Direct Settlement involving vehicle SNE7178H (Ours) & SJIX5955S (Your

Insured) DOA: 08/07/2022._ECICS ref: DMPC2200287H/GK

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir,

We will appoint LKK for the survey.

Aside to LKK Auto Consultants,

Please arrange survey for TPV today, location and contact as per content in the email.

Best regards

Genevieve Kua
Associate | Claims

cjcs
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DID (65) 6303 0308 Tel (65) 6337 4779
Email genevieve kua@ecics.com.sg Web www.ecics.com.sg
Address 10 Eunos Road 8, Singapore Post Centre, #09-04A, Singapore 408600

From: Juan Paulo Bongon Baldoz <juan.paulo@wearnes.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 13 July 2022 8:38 am

To: Genevieve Kua (ECICS, Claims) <Genevieve_Kua@ecics.com.sg>

Cc: Liu Chun Cheong (ECICS, Operations / Claims) <ChunCheong_Liu@ecics.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement involving vehicle SNE7178H (Ours) & SJIX5955S (Your Insured) DOA: 08/07/2022._ECICS
ref: DMPC2200287H/GK

Importance: High

Hi Genevieve,
We choose LKK Auto Consultants.

Thank you



Paulo
Service Consultant
Bodyshop & Paint

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd

V 45 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159103

M (65) 98270463
WEARNES Www.wearnesauto.com juan.paulo@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: Genevieve Kua (ECICS, Claims) <Genevieve Kua@ecics.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 12 July 2022 10:58 pm

To: Juan Paulo Bongon Baldoz <juan.paulo@wearnes.com>

Cc: Liu Chun Cheong (ECICS, Operations / Claims) <ChunCheong Liu@ecics.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement involving vehicle SNE7178H (Ours) & SIX5955S (Your Insured) DOA: 08/07/2022._ECICS
ref: DMPC2200287H/GK

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/Madam,

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's vehicle jointly with your client's workshop. We
propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the list below to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single
joint expert:

1. AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd
2. Appraisals Associates Pte Ltd

3. Infiniti Appraisal Services

4. LKK Auto Consultants

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor surveyors
as a single joint expert.

We look forward to hear from you soon.

Best regards

Genevieve Kua
Associate | Claims

cjcs
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DID (65) 6303 0308 Tel (65) 6337 4779
Email genevieve kua@ecics.com.sg Web www.ecics.com.sg
Address 10 Eunos Road 8, Singapore Post Centre, #09-04A, Singapore 408600

From: Juan Paulo Bongon Baldoz <juan.paulo@wearnes.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 12 July 2022 3:02 pm
To: ECICS Claims <claims@ecics.com.sg>




Cc: Liu Chun Cheong (ECICS, Operations / Claims) <ChunCheong Liu@ecics.com.sg>
Subject: Direct Settlement involving vehicle SNE7178H (Ours) & SIX5955S (Your Insured) DOA: 08/07/2022.
Importance: High

Dear officer-in-charge,

For claim registration.

Please arrange our client's vehicle for a pre-repair survey on 13 July 2022 (Wednesday).
Vehicle in our workshop at 45 Leng Kee Road JLR.

Besides, kindly check the liability on the said incident.

Kindly revert to us as soon as possible.

Thank you

Paulo
Service Consultant
Bodyshop & Paint

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd

V 45 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159103

M (65) 98270463
WEARNES Www.wearnesauto.com juan.paulo@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

This message may contain privileged and confidential information and is only intended for use by the addressee. No representation, warranty, guarantee or undertaking
expressed or implied is made by ECICS Limited; as to the fairness, accuracy or completeness of any information, projections or opinions contained in this message. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination either in whole or in part is prohibited. If you are not the addressee indicated in his message (or responsible for delivery of the
message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply email.
Opinions contained herein are the personal opinions of the sender and do not necessarily represent the views of ECICS Limited.

This message may contain privileged and confidential information and is only intended for use by the addressee. No representation, warranty, guarantee or undertaking
expressed or implied is made by ECICS Limited; as to the fairness, accuracy or completeness of any information, projections or opinions contained in this message. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination either in whole or in part is prohibited. If you are not the addressee indicated in his message (or responsible for delivery of the
message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply email.
Opinions contained herein are the personal opinions of the sender and do not necessarily represent the views of ECICS Limited.



