Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Subject:
Attachments:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/mdm,

Thank you for your acceptance.

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Thursday, 15 September 2022 10:16 AM

chan pick yuen

RE: SMZ6435Z & GBA1161H DOA 10.7.22

CTP-Fund Transfer Request Form-FA-Web.pdf; DV_SMZ6435Z.pdf

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

China Taiping Insurance is targeting to process all payments via e-payments. Hence, please complete and return the
attached Form to enable them to process payment.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 15 September 2022 8:32 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SMZ64357 & GBA1161H DOA 10.7.22

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Accept offer . DV please .

Best Regards
Chris Chan

Thanks



Get Outlook for 10S

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, September 14, 2022 5:31:15 PM
To: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Subject: RE: SMZ6435Z & GBA1161H DOA 10.7.22

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair $ 6,200.00
2. Loss of Rental (7days x $100.00) S 700.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee S 7.45

Total | $ 6,907.45

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 14 September 2022 10:39 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SMZ6435Z & GBA1161H DOA 10.7.22

Dear Hsiao Tong ,

Our rental cost very high & rental day is 7 days .
We request global sum all in $7000/- . Please let us have your DV soon . Thanks

Best Regards



Chris Chan
Lc Automotive

Get Outlook for 10S

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, September 13, 2022 6:12:13 PM

To: chan pick yuen <chris chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Subject: RE: SMZ6435Z & GBA1161H DOA 10.7.22

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair $ 6,200.00
2. Loss of Rental (6days x $100.00) S 600.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee S 7.45

Total | $ 6,807.45

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 September 2022 4:38 PM

To: Pauline Tham <pauline.tham @sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>; Adeline Chng <adeline.chng@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: Re: SMZ6435Z & GBA1161H DOA 10.7.22

Dear All ,

Final Reminder,



Without Prejudice

Our case submitted more than 2 month but still no heard from your offer yet ?This case
liability is clear 100 % . If your good officer do not settle in next 3 days . I have
my client instruction to process legal to claim against your insured policy . Thanks

Best Regards
Chris Chan

LC Automotive
Hp:92712214

Get Outlook for 10S

From: chan pick yuen <chris chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, September 5, 2022 12:15:42 PM

To: Pauline Tham <pauline.tham @sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Adeline Chng <adeline.chng@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: Re: SMZ6435Z & GBA1161H DOA 10.7.22

Dear All ,

Final Reminder,

Please let us have your settlement & reply by today . Thanks
Best Regards

Chris Chan

LC Automotive
Get Outlook for 10S

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Friday, September 2, 2022 11:22:52 AM

To: Pauline Tham <pauline.tham @sg.cntaiping.com>
Cc: Hsiao Tong <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SMZ6435Z & GBA1161H DOA 10.7.22

Dear Sir/ Mdm ,

Final Reminder,

Please let us have your offer by today . Thanks
Best Regards

Chris Chan

LC Automotive

Get Outlook for 10S




From: Adeline Chng <adeline.chng@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Thursday, August 25, 2022 10:19:46 AM

To: Pauline Tham <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com>
Cc: chan pick yuen <chris chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Subject: FW: SMZ6435Z & GBA1161H DOA 10.7.22

Hi pauline

Please assist. SNM22D204885

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as
delay is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. . Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Thank you.

Adeline Chng
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: (65) 6389 6155 | F: (65) 6224 7175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: & Vil Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please
notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Friday, August 19, 2022 12:30 PM

To: Adeline Chng <adeline.chng@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: Fwd: SMZ6435Z & GBA1161H DOA 10.7.22

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir/ Mdm ,

Our case submitted more than 1 month to LKK but no receive your OIC offer & reply yet ? Please let us have your
settlement in next 7 days . Thanks

Best Regards
Chris Chan

LC Automotive
Hp:92712214



From: chan pick yuen <chris _chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, July 19, 2022 10:22:10 AM

To: Hsiao Tong <chewht@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Fwd: SMZ6435Z & GBA1161H DOA 10.7.22

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Enclosed is the GIA report, LTA fee , RENTAL ,invoice, & LOA
As request following :

1)RC $6200.00 ( As agreed)

2) loss of rental $1050 ( $150 X 7 DAYS - 5 days recommend + 1 day waiting PRS + 1
DAY WEEKEND )

3) LTA FEE $7.45

@ 100% TOTAL $7257.45 /-- ( 3 vehicle chain collision )

Please let us have your settlement soon . Thanks

Best Regards
Chris Chan

LC AUTOMOTIVE
HP: 92712214



