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ASHER SNG

(As agreed)

DipEng, AAE MIMI, MSAE(Aust)

Chan San Choon
Director

For your prompt payment.
Thank you.

Yours faithfully,
Ryder Auto Pte Ltd

Please arrange for DV to be signed by us (workshop) because we are authorised by client to sign on
behalf.   Please see attached Letter of authorisation ( see note 5) .

ACCIDENT INVOLVING : SNA4968K & SLX9810B ALONG 11 UNITY STREET CARPARK ON 6/7/22
VEHICLE # :

SNA4968K

Dear Sir,

Motor Claims Dept

Our Ref :

LETTER OF DEMAND

Attn:

SNA4968K

4/10/2022AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way 
#08-06 
Singapore 079120

Your Ref : -

COST OF REPAIR ADD GST 7%

TOTAL

COST OF REPAIR $1,600.00
RENTAL $642.00
LTA & GIA SEARCH $7.45

Two Thousand Three Hundred Sixty-One Singapore Dollars and
Forty-Five Cents Only

$112.00

$2,361.45

Mei Kwan
Stamp
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(1181)

ASHER SNG

(As agreed)

DipEng, AAE MIMI, MSAE(Aust)

Chan San Choon
Director

For your prompt payment.
Thank you.

Yours faithfully,
Ryder Auto Pte Ltd

Please arrange for DV to be signed by us (workshop) because we are authorised by client to sign on
behalf.   Please see attached Letter of authorisation ( see note 5) .

ACCIDENT INVOLVING : SNA4968K & SLX9810B ALONG 11 UNITY STREET CARPARK ON 6/7/22
VEHICLE # :

SNA4968K

Dear Sir,

Motor Claims Dept

Our Ref :

TAX INVOICE

Attn:

SNA4968K

4/10/2022AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way 
#08-06 
Singapore 079120

Your Ref : -

COST OF REPAIR ADD GST 7%

TOTAL

$1,600.00COST OF REPAIR 

$112.00

$1,712.00

One Thousand Seven Hundred Twelve Singapore Dollars Only

Mei Kwan
Stamp











Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 07 Jul 2022 / 09:59:22

Receipt Date/Time : 07 Jul 2022 / 09:59:21

Tax Invoice/Receipt

Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-220707-000662

Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Item Description/
Business Transaction Reference 
No.

Amount 
Before

GST (S$)

GST 
Amount 

(S$)

Amount 
After GST 

(S$)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - SLX9810B
As at 06 Jul 2022/23:45:00
Insurance Co: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.

1 Insurance Enquiry - SLX9810B
Enquiry Fee 
20220707095901301160

7.00 0.49 7.49

Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49

Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49

Rounding Difference 0.04

Total Amount Payable 7.45

Paid By

n8v1xy21 Credit Card 7.45

Total 7.45

Cash Change 0.00

Tendered Amount 7.45

Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service 
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee 

may apply.
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EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 12 January 2023 5:16 PM
To: devinong8@gmail.com
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: RE-SEND /ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLX9810B (AIG) AND SNA4968K AT/ALONG 11 

UNITY STREET ON 07/07/2022

Dear Devin, 
 
My apologies as accidentally used my ex-colleague’s email address.   
 
With warmest regards, 
Ezlyna  
 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Thursday, 12 January 2023 5:13 PM 
To: devinong8@gmail.com 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLX9810B (AIG) AND SNA4968K AT/ALONG 11 UNITY STREET ON 07/07/2022 
 
Dear Sylvia Lee Siew Kian & Devin Ong Yong Ming, 
                 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLX9810B (AIG) AND SNA4968K AT/ALONG 11 UNITY STREET ON 07/07/2022 
 
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. to deal with the third-party claim against your policy. 
 
We have received a claim from SNA4968K against your insurance policy. 
 
Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information given us 
your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate 
for an amicable settlement with third party claimant. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us 
within 07 days from the date of this letter. 
 
You are aware that your No-Claim Discount (NCD – if applicable) will be withheld for the time being. Pending for final 
allocation of liability in settlement by our principal AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd. 
 
*As per our tele conversation earlier today, will update you once we have obtained video footage from third party. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 

Ezlyna Eng | Case Handler   

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: Ezlyna@lkkauto.com |  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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