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Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Chen How Ng <chenhow.ng@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 7 July 2022 3:05 PM
To: assignments@lkkauto.com
Subject: FW: Request for Paper Resurvey: ACCIDENT BETWEEN YP8454R AND SJR8630R ON 

04/03/2020 || C10005810
Attachments: Automax Surveyor Report.pdf; LKKPreRepairInspection_1439264.pdf; LKK+photo_

1439263.pdf

 
 

From: Chen How Ng  
Sent: Thursday, 7 July 2022 3:03 pm 
To: admin_d@lkkauto.com 
Subject: FW: Request for Paper Resurvey: ACCIDENT BETWEEN YP8454R AND SJR8630R ON 04/03/2020 || C10005810 
 
 
 

From: Chen How Ng  
Sent: Thursday, 7 July 2022 2:52 pm 
To: admin_d@lkkauto.com 
Subject: FW: Request for Paper Resurvey: ACCIDENT BETWEEN YP8454R AND SJR8630R ON 04/03/2020 || C10005810 
 
 
 

From: Chen How Ng  
Sent: Thursday, 7 July 2022 2:51 pm 
To: 'admin_d@lkkauto.com' <admin_d@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: Request for Paper Resurvey: ACCIDENT BETWEEN YP8454R AND SJR8630R ON 04/03/2020 || C10005810 
 
 
 

From: Chen How Ng  
Sent: Monday, 30 May 2022 12:09 pm 
To: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Request for Paper Resurvey: ACCIDENT BETWEEN YP8454R AND SJR8630R ON 04/03/2020 || C10005810 
 
Hi Team, 
 
Please do a paper resurvey of 3rd party YP8454R. 
 
 
Best Regards 
 
Ng Chen How 
Senior Executive, Claims 
 
T +65 6989 3698 
F +65 6725 0853   
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E chenhow.ng@budgetdirect.com.sg 
 

 
 
Customer Care +65 6221 2111 
Claims +65 6221 2199 
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199 
 
190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01 
Singapore Shopping Centre 
Singapore 239924                                                                                                                                  
budgetdirect.com.sg 
 

 
 
Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct Insurance. 
 
This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended 
addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect 
views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended 
addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is 
unauthorised.  

 
 
 
 

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 10 March 2020 4:43 pm 
To: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Loganathan Agoram <loganathan.a@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: Fw: ACCIDENT BETWEEN YP8454R AND SJR8630R ON 04/03/2020 || C10005810 
 
Hi Team, 
 
We would like to arrange TP PRS for YP8454R.  TP has chosen Mr. Xing Guo Qiang to survey this vehicle. 
 
Workshop information: 
MK Vehicle Engineering Pte Ltd 
48 Toh Guan Road East #04-124 
Enterprise Hub 
Singapore  608586 
Tel : 67636363 
Attn : Mr Troy Goh   
 
Please arrange  the survey on 11.03.2020 at 3pm. 
 
Kindly confirm.  Thank you. 
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Regards, 

  

Ivy Ratilla 

Executive, Claims Admin 

  

T +65 6540 2185 

F +65 6725 0853   

Eivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg 

  

 

  

Customer Care +65 6221 2111 

Claims +65 6221 2199 

Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199 

  

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01 

Singapore Shopping Centre 

Singapore 
239924                                                                                                                                  

budgetdirect.com.sg 
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From: AXIS LAW CORPORATION <enquiries.axislaw@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, 10 March 2020 16:27 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Cc: Alina Sim <alina@axislaw.com.sg>; Loganathan Agoram <loganathan.a@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT BETWEEN YP8454R AND SJR8630R ON 04/03/2020 || C10005810  
  
Dear Ivy,  
 
Our client would like to appoint  Xing Guo Qiang LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd to conduct the co-survey with our client's 
surveyor  Stanley Fong of Automax Survey. 
 
Please arrange  the survey on 11.03.2020 at 3pm at our client's workshop. The address is as follows;- 
 
MK Vehicle Engineering Pte Ltd 
48 Toh Guan Road East #04-124 
Enterprise Hub 
Singapore  608586 
Tel : 67636363 
Attn : Mr Troy Goh                    
  
Regards, 
Alice (Secretary) 
For Alina Sim 
AXIS LAW CORPORATION 
163 Tras Street 
#06-04 
Singapore 079024 
Advocates & Solicitors 
Commissioners For Oaths 
Notaries Public 
Tel   : 6535 6850 
Fax : 6532 3490 
Email : enquiries.axislaw@gmail.com  
         : enquiry@axislaw.com.sg 
Website : www.axislaw.com.sg 
 
NOTICE : This email may be privileged from disclosure and is for the 
intended recipient. If you have received this in error, please notify us, do 
not disseminate the message and delete it from your computer. 
Thank you. 
 
NOTE : There have been cases where false emails were sent out purportedly by Law Entities to request for payment. To 
prevent fraud from occurring, we would be very grateful if you could make a telephone call to our office at 65 6535 
6850 to confirm that the email was from us before sending any payment or deposit. Thank you. 
 
 

From: AXIS LAW CORPORATION <enquiries.axislaw@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, 9 March 2020 16:54 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Cc: Alina Sim <alina@axislaw.com.sg> 
Subject: ACCIDENT BETWEEN YP8454R AND SJR8630R ON 04/03/2020  
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Dear Ms Ivy,  
 
We attach a copy of our Notice to the insurer for the above accident for your attention. 
 
 
Regards, 
Alice (Secretary) 
For Alina Sim 
AXIS LAW CORPORATION 
163 Tras Street 
#06-04 
Singapore 079024 
Advocates & Solicitors 
Commissioners For Oaths 
Notaries Public 
Tel   : 6535 6850 
Fax : 6532 3490 
Email : enquiries.axislaw@gmail.com  
         : enquiry@axislaw.com.sg 
Website : www.axislaw.com.sg 
 
NOTICE : This email may be privileged from disclosure and is for the 
intended recipient. If you have received this in error, please notify us, do 
not disseminate the message and delete it from your computer. 
Thank you. 
 
NOTE : There have been cases where false emails were sent out purportedly by Law Entities to request for payment. To 
prevent fraud from occurring, we would be very grateful if you could make a telephone call to our office at 65 6535 
6850 to confirm that the email was from us before sending any payment or deposit. Thank you. 
This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited, 
Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended addressee. The 
views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views 
of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended 
addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this 
email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify the sender and then delete the 
email. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free.  


