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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 29 December 2022 8:10 AM
To: Angela Tan
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: THIRD PARTY CLAIM SMA138C & YP9266K ACCIDENT ON 3.7.2022

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 
Dear Sirs 
 
Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at S$32,771.45 (all in) in full and 
final settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their insured 
arising out of this incident.  
 
If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of the Letter of Authorization / 
Warrant to Act  and your Bank details for us to process payment.   
 
Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full discharge of 
liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore 
and/or our insured as a result of the accident on 03 July 2022.  
 
Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or 
payments constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability. 
 
Thank you.  
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 28 December 2022 1:11 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: THIRD PARTY CLAIM SMA138C & YP9266K ACCIDENT ON 3.7.2022 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
We confirmed and acceptance offer. 
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Thank you. 
 
 
Regards  
Angela Tan 
Motor Claims Executive (B&P Dept) 
Email: angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg 
Phone: +65 9644 3110 
60, Jalan Lam Huat  
#06-41/42/43/54/55 & #07-43 
Carros Centre 
Singapore 737869 
 

 
 
 
 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 28 December 2022 12:45 PM 
To: Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: THIRD PARTY CLAIM SMA138C & YP9266K ACCIDENT ON 3.7.2022 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
We propose settlement as follows: - 
  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 31,064.00 
2. Loss of Use (17days x $100.00) $   1,700.00 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $          7.45 

Total $ 32,771.45 
  
Please confirm acceptance. 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Chan, Kian Chuan (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <kianchuan.chan@allianz.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 21 December 2022 11:19 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg>; S O Krishnan, Ghandian (Allianz Insurance Singapore) 
<ghandian.krishnan@allianz.sg> 
Subject: FW: THIRD PARTY CLAIM SMA138C & YP9266K ACCIDENT ON 3.7.2022 
 

Internal 
 
 
 
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 
Hi Angela,  
 
Thank you for your email.  
 
Hi LKK,  
 
Fyna, please.  
 
 
Thank you.  
 
Warmest Regards,  
 
KC Chan 
Claims & Performance Management Department 
 
Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 
79 Robinson Road #09-01 Singapore 068897 
www.allianz.sg  
 

 

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential 
and / or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of 
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 

P Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 
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From: Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, December 20, 2022 3:45 PM 
To: Chan, Kian Chuan (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <kianchuan.chan@allianz.sg> 
Cc: S O Krishnan, Ghandian (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <ghandian.krishnan@allianz.sg> 
Subject: [EXT] RE: THIRD PARTY CLAIM SMA138C & YP9266K ACCIDENT ON 3.7.2022 
 
Dear Kian Chuan, 
 
Please revert us your offer soon. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
Regards  
Angela Tan 
Motor Claims Executive (B&P Dept) 
Email: angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg 
Phone: +65 9644 3110 
60, Jalan Lam Huat  
#06-41/42/43/54/55 & #07-43 
Carros Centre 
Singapore 737869 
 

 
 
 
 
 

From: S O Krishnan, Ghandian (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <ghandian.krishnan@allianz.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 24 November 2022 2:10 PM 
To: Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg> 
Cc: Chan, Kian Chuan (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <kianchuan.chan@allianz.sg> 
Subject: FW: THIRD PARTY CLAIM SMA138C & YP9266K ACCIDENT ON 3.7.2022 
 

Internal 
 
Dear Angela 
 
Our Kian Chuan will respond to this TPD claim. He will respond next week. Thanks 
 
Best Regards 
 
K.Ghandian 
Manager 
Claims & Performance Management 
 
Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897 
DID: +65 6395 8157 | www.allianz.sg  
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Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged 
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify 
the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 

 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 
 
 
 

From: Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, November 15, 2022 9:45 AM 
To: S O Krishnan, Ghandian (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <ghandian.krishnan@allianz.sg>; Claims Banca (Allianz 
Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Cc: insuregeneralpl (insuregeneralpl@gmail.com) <insuregeneralpl@gmail.com>; Leong Chee Kwong 
<cheekwong.leong@munichautocare.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXT] RE: THIRD PARTY CLAIM SMA138C & YP9266K ACCIDENT ON 3.7.2022 
 
Hi Sir/Madam, 
  
We refer to the attach reference. 
  
Please find attached a copy of our Letter of Demand for your kind perusal. 
  
We would appreciate if you could revert us with your offer soonest. 
  
Thank you and awaiting for your favorable reply. 
  
 
Regards  
Angela Tan 
Motor Claims Executive (B&P Dept) 
Email: angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg 
Phone: +65 9644 3110 
60, Jalan Lam Huat  
#06-41/42/43/54/55 & #07-43 
Carros Centre 
Singapore 737869 
 

 
 
 
 
 

From: S O Krishnan, Ghandian (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <ghandian.krishnan@allianz.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 12 September 2022 4:34 PM 
To: Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg>; Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) 
<claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Cc: insuregeneralpl (insuregeneralpl@gmail.com) <insuregeneralpl@gmail.com>; Leong Chee Kwong 
<cheekwong.leong@munichautocare.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: THIRD PARTY CLAIM SMA138C & YP9266K ACCIDENT ON 3.7.2022 
 

Internal 
 
Dear Angela 
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WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Kindly your client’s claim and support with all relevant documents for a prompt settlement. Thanks 
 
Best Regards 
 
K.Ghandian 
Manager 
Claims & Performance Management 
 
Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897 
DID: +65 6395 8157 | www.allianz.sg  
 

 

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged 
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify 
the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 

 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 
 
 
 

From: Angela Tan <angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 5, 2022 9:20 AM 
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Cc: insuregeneralpl (insuregeneralpl@gmail.com) <insuregeneralpl@gmail.com>; Leong Chee Kwong 
<cheekwong.leong@munichautocare.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXT] THIRD PARTY CLAIM SMA138C & YP9266K ACCIDENT ON 3.7.2022 
 
To: Allianz Motor Claims Dept. (Arrangement of Surveyor Unit) 
 
RE: NOTICE TO THIRD PARTY INSURERS TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 2 WORKINGS DAY 
PURSUANT TO PARAGRAPH PHOTOCOL FOR NIN-INJURY MOTOR ACCIDENT CLAIMS (NIMA) ACCIDENT 
INVOLVING SMA138C & YP9266K ALONG TOWARDS DUNEARN ROAD ON 03/07/2022 
 
We are repairer for BIS MOTORING PTE LTD the owner of vehicle no SMA138C 
 
Munich Autocare Pte Ltd 
60 Jalan Lam Huat #06-43 Singapore 737869 
Mobile No: 96443110 Email: angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg 
 
Contact Person: Angela Tan 
 
PLEASE ARRANGE OFFICER-IN-CHARGE TO LET US KNOW ASAP IF WE COULD DO DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR THIS CASE 
 
 
Please also provide us a list of 10 surveyors as your nominated SJE (Single Joint Expert) 
 
 
 
Regards  
Angela Tan 
Motor Claims Executive (B&P Dept) 
Email: angela.tan@munichautocare.com.sg 
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Phone: +65 9644 3110 
60, Jalan Lam Huat  
#06-41/42/43/54/55 & #07-43 
Carros Centre 
Singapore 737869 
 

 
 
 


