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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 5 September 2022 3:40 PM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: Finalization of SHB8075B

  

From: Goh Wee Dek <weedek.goh@premierauto.com.sg> 

Sent: Monday, 5 September 2022 3:37:31 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Finalization of SHB8075B 

Thanks 

  

Regards 

  

Goh Wee Dek 

Assistant Claims Manager 

Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd 

  

Address:  23  Changi  So uth Ave 2 ,  #01-02 S ingapore 486443 

Tel :  6214 8880 EXT:  068  |   DID:    6544 6682  |   Fax:    6214 1511  

Premier Taxis Pte Ltd |  Premier Rent A Car Pte Ltd |  Premier Automotive Services  Pte Ltd |  Premier Land (East) 

Pte Ltd |  Premier Realty  Pte Ltd  

Vis i t  us  at :  www.premier-rentacar.com  |  www.premiertaxi .com.sg  

  

  
N o t e :  P l e a s e  b e  i n f o r m e d  t h a t  w e  h a v e  c h a n g e d  o u r  e m a i l  f r o m  w e e d e k . g o h @ p r e m i e r t a x i . c o m  t o  

w e e d e k . g o h @ p r e m i e r a u t o . c o m . s g  

Confidentiality Notice | This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential or 
proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, immediately contact 
the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message. 

  
 Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE POLLUTION 
 
  
  

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) [mailto:taufikh@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, 5 September 2022 3:36 pm 

To: Goh Wee Dek <weedek.goh@premierauto.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: Finalization of SHB8075B 

  

Hi Goh, 

  

COR l/s $1000 , 2 days. 

  

Subject to insurance approval. 

  

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 
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From: Goh Wee Dek [mailto:weedek.goh@premierauto.com.sg]  

Sent: Friday, 12 August 2022 1:04 PM 
To: Taufikh (LKK Auto) 

Subject: FW: Finalization of SHB8075B 
  

Dear Taufikh 

  

Please finalize soonest. 

  

Regards 

  

Goh Wee Dek 

Assistant Claims Manager 

Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd 

  

Address:  23  Changi  So uth Ave 2 ,  #01-02 S ingapore 486443 

Tel :  6214 8880 EXT:  068  |   DID:    6544 6682  |   Fax:    6214 1511  

Premier Taxis Pte Ltd |  Premier Rent A Car Pte Ltd |  Premier Automotive Services  Pte Ltd |  Premier Land (East) 

Pte Ltd |  Premier Realty  Pte Ltd  

Vis i t  us  at :  www.premier-rentacar.com  |  www.premiertaxi .com.sg  

  

  
N o t e :  P l e a s e  b e  i n f o r m e d  t h a t  w e  h a v e  c h a n g e d  o u r  e m a i l  f r o m  w e e d e k . g o h @ p r e m i e r t a x i . c o m  t o  

w e e d e k . g o h @ p r e m i e r a u t o . c o m . s g  

Confidentiality Notice | This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential or 
proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, immediately contact 
the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message. 

  
 Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE POLLUTION 
 
  
  

From: Goh Wee Dek  

Sent: Saturday, 23 July 2022 10:08 am 

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com 

Subject: FW: Finalization of SHB8075B 

  

Dear Taufikh 

  

Please confirm finalize soonest. 

  

Regards 

  

Goh Wee Dek 

Assistant Claims Manager 

Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd 

  

Address:  23  Changi  So uth Ave 2 ,  #01-02 S ingapore 486443 

Tel :  6214 8880 EXT:  068  |   DID:    6544 6682  |   Fax:    6214 1511  

Premier Taxis Pte Ltd |  Premier Rent A Car Pte Ltd |  Premier Automotive Services  Pte Ltd |  Premier Land (East) 

Pte Ltd |  Premier Realty  Pte Ltd  

Vis i t  us  at :  www.premier-rentacar.com  |  www.premiertaxi .com.sg  

  

  
N o t e :  P l e a s e  b e  i n f o r m e d  t h a t  w e  h a v e  c h a n g e d  o u r  e m a i l  f r o m  w e e d e k . g o h @ p r e m i e r t a x i . c o m  t o  

w e e d e k . g o h @ p r e m i e r a u t o . c o m . s g  
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Confidentiality Notice | This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential or 
proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, immediately contact 
the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message. 

  
 Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE POLLUTION 
 
  
  

From: Ng Boon Kai  

Sent: Thursday, 14 July 2022 2:10 pm 

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Goh Wee Dek <weedek.goh@premierauto.com.sg>; Vincent Chua <vincent.chua@premierauto.com.sg> 

Subject: Finalization of SHB8075B 

  

Hi Taufikh, 

  

Attached is finalization report and after repair photo for the above mentioned vehicle. 

  

COR=$1000.00 

Repair days-04 

  

Kindly confirm 

  

  
  
Thank you 
  
Regards 
  
Boon Kai 
Claims Executive 
Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd 
  
Ad d res s :  23  Ch an g i  Sou th  Av e 2 ,  #0 1- 02  S in gap ore  4 86 443  
Tel :  65 44  6 68 9 E xt  0 71  |  F ax:  621 4  1 511  
Vis i t  u s  at :  w ww.p r em i er tax i .co m . sg  

Confidentiality Notice | This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential or 
proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, immediately contact 
the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message. 

  
 Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE POLLUTION 
 
  

  

  


