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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 30 August 2022 9:47 AM
To: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
Subject: RE: [Our Ref: SLZ 155 H] (Attn: Ms Chew Hsiao Tong) LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING 

SLZ 155 H & SHD 5131 G ON 29 JUNE 2022
Attachments: DS FORM_SLZ155H.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for your acceptance. 
 
Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return together with your client’s authorisation to act to us (LKK) for 
our necessary action. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 30 August 2022 7:37 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: [Our Ref: SLZ 155 H] (Attn: Ms Chew Hsiao Tong) LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLZ 155 H & SHD 5131 G 
ON 29 JUNE 2022 
 
Dear Ms Chew, 
 
We are pleased to inform that we accept your kind offer of $7,100.00 (all-in). 
 
We seek your kindest assistance in forwarding us the DV and we aim to revert with the endorsed DV asap. 
 
Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest. 
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Regards, 
Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd 
asiamotorsports@hotmail.com 
 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Monday, August 29, 2022 11:28 AM 
To: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com> 
Subject: RE: [Our Ref: SLZ 155 H] (Attn: Ms Chew Hsiao Tong) LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLZ 155 H & SHD 5131 G 
ON 29 JUNE 2022  
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
Thank you for your email. 
  
We propose settlement at a global sum of $7,100.00(all-in). 
  
Please confirm acceptance. 
  
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Saturday, 27 August 2022 1:26 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: [Our Ref: SLZ 155 H] (Attn: Ms Chew Hsiao Tong) LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLZ 155 H & SHD 5131 G 
ON 29 JUNE 2022 
  
Dear Ms Chew, 
  
As requested, please see attached for the rental agreement. 
  
We look forward to receiving your kind DV soonest. 
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Thank you. 
  
Regards, 
Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd 
asiamotorsports@hotmail.com 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, August 24, 2022 3:00 PM 
To: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com> 
Subject: RE: [Our Ref: SLZ 155 H] (Attn: Ms Chew Hsiao Tong) LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLZ 155 H & SHD 5131 G 
ON 29 JUNE 2022  
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/mdm, 
  
Thank you for your email. 
  
We would like to request for a copy of rental agreement for our necessary action. 
  
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 23 August 2022 10:09 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: [Our Ref: SLZ 155 H] (Attn: Ms Chew Hsiao Tong) LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLZ 155 H & SHD 5131 G ON 
29 JUNE 2022 
  
Your Ref:  
Our Ref: SLZ 155 H 
  
17 Aug 2022 
  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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Blk 51 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-25 
Paya Ubi Industrial Park 
Singapore 408933 
  
PROPERTY CLAIM (WITHOUT PREJUDICE TO: Any Personal Injury Claims) 
  
Via Email 
  
Attn: Ms Chew Hsiao Tong 
  
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
  
LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLZ 155 H & SHD 5131 G ON 29 JUNE 2022 
  
Thank you for responding to our call for Pre-Repair Inspection and your subsequent correspondences with 
us regarding the above-mentioned accident. 
  
We are pleased to inform that we are agreeable to SJE proposed lump sum repair.  As such, kindly find 
below a breakdown of the total demand amount: 
  
Cost of Repair:         $   6,200.00 (as agreed with SJE) 
Loss of Rental:         $   1,440.00 
LTA search fee:          $          7.45 
  
Total:                $   7,647.45 
  
Please also find attached the GIA report (from our client), marked estimate (as agreed with SJE), 
replacement vehicle rental invoice, LTA search receipt and our repair invoice. 
  
We look forward to receiving your Discharge Voucher and hearing from you soonest. 
  
Thank you. 
  
Regards, 
Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd 
asiamotorsports@hotmail.com 


