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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Wennis Liew <wennis.liew@premierauto.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 12 December 2022 11:00 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: AccReport; Admin A; CS A Team
Subject: RE: LKK REF: CC4/GRB22006218/Vga3  - LOD / Accident involving SMF9732B and 

SNC4722S on 24/06/2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/GRB22006218/Vga3
Attachments: SMF9732B 24062022 DV ATA and Tax Inv.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Thank you for the documents. 
 
Please find attached signed DV , ATA and Tax Invoice for your kind attention. 
 
*For swift payment processing and to adopt an environmentally friendly lifestyle, we prefer E-Payment via Bank 
Transfer/PayNow. 
 
Please find appended below our company bank details for your payment arrangement. 
 

Account Name: Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd 

Bank Name: DBS Bank Ltd 

Bank Account No.: 0039052367 

Bank Branch: Marina Boulevard 

Bank Code: 7171 

Swift Code: DBSSSGSG 

PAYNOW UEN 200707743D 
 
We look forward to receive the payment soon. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Warmest regards, 
 
Wennis Liew 
Claims Executive 
Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd 
  
Address:  23  Changi  South Ave 2 ,  #01-02 Singapore 486443 
Tel:  6214 8880 EXT:  076  |   DID:    6410 0946  |   Fax:    6214 1511 
Premier Taxis Pte Ltd | Premier Rent A Car Pte Ltd | Premier Automotive Services  Pte Ltd |  Premier Land (East) 
Pte Ltd |  Premier Realty  Pte Ltd  
Vis i t  us  at:  www.premier-rentacar .com  |  www.premiertaxi .com.sg  

Confidentiality Notice | This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential or 
proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, immediately contact 
the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message. 
 
 Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE POLLUTION 
 
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Claim Audit

 

  AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
29 Jun
2022
16:02

Clm Dtl Modified Claimant's Name: -> PREMIER RENT A CAR PTE LTD. Claimant's ID: -> 200612929E. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

2
29 Jun
2022
16:02

Clm Veh Model
Changed (206171) MAZDA 6 2.0 SEDAN EXECUTIVE 2WD (A). [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

3
29 Jun
2022
16:02

Clm Created
Reg No: SMF9732B. Acct Date: 2022/06/24. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: India International Ins
urance Pte Ltd (HQ). TP Insurer: NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ). Workshop:
Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd (HQ)

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

4
29 Jun
2022
16:02

Adj Co Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

5
29 Jun
2022
16:02

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/07/08 [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

6
29 Jun
2022
16:02

Adj Mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

7
29 Jun
2022
16:03

Assignment 1st
Accessed

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

8
29 Jun
2022
16:03

Label Added (30653):Direct Settlement. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

9
29 Jun
2022
16:03

Adj Adjuster
Assigned [None] -> Thevan Thomas Karthikesavan [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

10
04 Jul
2022
11:07

Adj Mandate
Request Cur.Req:0.00:PODS LIABILITY: TBA REMARKS: PLEASE REQ VF FROM OI. THANKS [A] Chong Pui

Lin

11
04 Jul
2022
14:06

Adj Next Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/07/08. Mandate Remarks: Will upload once we receive the
video [I] Sherini Pillai

12
04 Jul
2022
14:06

Adj Mandate Set Maintained:Will upload once we receive the video [I] Sherini Pillai

13
05 Oct
2022
16:29

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - OID [A] AiXin

14
21 Oct
2022
09:21

Adj Rpt Initiated
[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

15
21 Oct
2022
09:21

Clm Dtl Modified Insured Name: -> -. Insured ID: -> -. Claim Conclusion: -> 3.
[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

16
21 Oct
2022
09:21

Clm Dtl Modified JPJ Reg. Date: -> 2018/11/30.
[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

17
21 Oct
2022
09:21

Clm Details
Notified

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

18
28 Oct
2022
10:33

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - OID [A] CHEW

HSIAO TONG

19
06 Nov
2022
11:13

Adj Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:2735.95:Liability: 50% OID CHANGED LANE WHILE TP MOVE OUT FROM PARKING L
OT *Quantum: $2,735.95 (all-in). Pls refer to adjuster report for details. *For your approval
please.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

20
07 Nov
2022
09:38

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - OID [I] Sherini Pillai

21
07 Nov
2022
09:40

Adj Mandate Set Approved:2735.95. [I] Sherini Pillai

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go

ACTIVITY
No record

Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2810796 30 Jun 2022
09:45:21

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

India
International
Insurance Pte

Ltd (HQ)

SMF9732B SNC4722S 11.00

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=101987940&CFTOKEN=30147be0636403ca-5784B820-D297-EBE9-C6D1C71CD8EF7CA8&USID=3251&RID=5747635
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=101987940&CFTOKEN=30147be0636403ca-5784B820-D297-EBE9-C6D1C71CD8EF7CA8&USID=3251&RID=5747635
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=101987940&CFTOKEN=30147be0636403ca-5784B820-D297-EBE9-C6D1C71CD8EF7CA8&USID=3251&RID=5747635
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=101987940&CFTOKEN=30147be0636403ca-5784B820-D297-EBE9-C6D1C71CD8EF7CA8&USID=3251&RID=5747635&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DMTRadjuster%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_viewhistory%26caseid%3D1108191%26extid%3D389280%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=101987940&CFTOKEN=30147be0636403ca-5784B820-D297-EBE9-C6D1C71CD8EF7CA8&USID=3251&RID=5747635
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2813921 05 Jul 2022
11:20:07 Video Upload Motor

India
International
Insurance Pte

Ltd (HQ)

India
International
Insurance Pte

Ltd (HQ)

SMF9732B Sherini Pillai xx.xx

2858521 21 Oct 2022
09:21:53

OD/TP Case
(Adjuster) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

LKK Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd (HQ)

SMF9732B SNC4722S 11.00
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