
Re: Request for Quotation - Mechanical Inspection of Prime Mover (Woodlands
Division)

Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com>
Wed 13/7/2022 12:42 PM

To: Pei Fang GOH (SPF) <GOH_Pei_Fang@spf.gov.sg>
Cc: Swee Peng (LKKAuto) <ongsp@lkkauto.com>;Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

2 attachments (3 MB)
SPF1_LKKInvoice_AC2204227.pdf; XD 1081D (Prime Mover) Report.pdf;

Hello IO Goh

Attached are the report and invoice. Please take a look and get back to me if there are any questions.

Best Regards,
Sherwin Beh | Technical Investigator
LKK Auto Consultants
Office: 6256 3561  | Email:  SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933)

From: Pei Fang GOH (SPF) <GOH_Pei_Fang@spf.gov.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 29 June 2022 9:33 am

To: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Swee Peng (LKKAuto) <ongsp@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Request for Quotation - Mechanical Inspection of Prime Mover (Woodlands Division)
 
Dear Sir,
 
              The reference number is: L/20220427/0057
 
Thank you.
 
 
GOH Pei Fang
Investigation Officer | GIS 1
Woodlands Division, Investigation Branch
Singapore Police Force
DID:6736 0166

Singapore Police Force    W police.gov.sg    FB fb.com/singaporepoliceforce    IG
Instagram.com/singaporepoliceforce
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From: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, 28 June 2022 9:40 pm

To: Pei Fang GOH (SPF) <GOH_Pei_Fang@spf.gov.sg>

Cc: Swee Peng (LKKAuto) <ongsp@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Request for Quotation - Mechanical Inspection of Prime Mover (Woodlands Division)
 
Hello IO Pei Fang 
 
May I have your Reference number to be added to the report? 
 
Best Regards,
Sherwin Beh | Technical Investigator
LKK Auto Consultants
Office: 6256 3561  | Email:  SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933)
 

From: Pei Fang GOH (SPF) <GOH_Pei_Fang@spf.gov.sg>

Sent: Monday, 20 June 2022 11:42 pm

To: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Swee Peng (LKKAuto) <ongsp@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Request for Quotation - Mechanical Inspection of Prime Mover (Woodlands Division)
 
Dear Sherwin,
 
              You can contact me at the landline, or 9731 2849.

Thank you.
 
 
Goh Pei Fang
Investigation Officer | GIS 1
Woodlands Division, Investigation Branch
DID: (65) 6736 0166
 

Singapore Police Force    W police.gov.sg    FB fb.com/singaporepoliceforce    IG
Instagram.com/singaporepoliceforce

 
WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you
must not copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any
unauthorized person is an offence under the Official Secrets Act 1935. Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this
in error.
 
 
 
From: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Monday, 20 June 2022 11:51 am

To: Pei Fang GOH (SPF) <GOH_Pei_Fang@spf.gov.sg>
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Cc: Swee Peng (LKKAuto) <ongsp@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Request for Quotation - Mechanical Inspection of Prime Mover (Woodlands Division)
 
Hello IO Pei Fang
 
May I have your contact number for ease of communication? 
 
Best Regards,
Sherwin Beh | Technical Investigator
LKK Auto Consultants
Office: 6256 3561  | Email:  SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933)
 

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 17 June 2022 12:33 pm

To: Pei Fang GOH (SPF) <GOH_Pei_Fang@spf.gov.sg>; Swee Peng (LKKAuto) <ongsp@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Request for Quotation - Mechanical Inspection of Prime Mover (Woodlands Division)
 
Dear Sherwin
 
Please make arrangement for the inspection as we have received the PO.
 
Best Regards,
Bryan Ang
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
From: Pei Fang GOH (SPF) <GOH_Pei_Fang@spf.gov.sg> 

Sent: Friday, 17 June 2022 10:16 am

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>; Swee Peng (LKKAuto) <ongsp@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Request for Quotation - Mechanical Inspection of Prime Mover (Woodlands Division)
 
Dear Bryan,
 
              My finance has resolved the matter.
 
Thank you very much for your assistance!
 
 
Goh Pei Fang
Investigation Officer | GIS 1
Woodlands Division, Investigation Branch
DID: (65) 6736 0166
 

Singapore Police Force    W police.gov.sg    FB fb.com/singaporepoliceforce    IG
Instagram.com/singaporepoliceforce
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WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you
must not copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any
unauthorized person is an offence under the Official Secrets Act 1935. Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this
in error.
 
 
 
From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Thursday, 16 June 2022 2:58 pm

To: Pei Fang GOH (SPF) <GOH_Pei_Fang@spf.gov.sg>; Swee Peng (LKKAuto) <ongsp@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Request for Quotation - Mechanical Inspection of Prime Mover (Woodlands Division)
 
Hi IO Pei Fang
 
I think it should be a new contract number as it was a fresh tender.
 
Dear Swee Peng
 
Able to assist for the contact number for Traffic Police mechanical inspection service?
 
Best Regards,
Bryan Ang
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

From: Pei Fang GOH (SPF) <GOH_Pei_Fang@spf.gov.sg> 

Sent: Thursday, 16 June 2022 12:09 pm

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Request for Quotation - Mechanical Inspection of Prime Mover (Woodlands Division)
 
Dear Bryan,
 
              I was informed that the contract number: 4500003527 expired on 29/05/2022.
 
2            May I know if there is a new contract number or it is maintained?

Thank you and apologies for the trouble.
 
 
Goh Pei Fang
Investigation Officer | GIS 1
Woodlands Division, Investigation Branch
DID: (65) 6736 0166
 

Singapore Police Force    W police.gov.sg    FB fb.com/singaporepoliceforce    IG
Instagram.com/singaporepoliceforce
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WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you
must not copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any
unauthorized person is an offence under the Official Secrets Act 1935. Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this
in error.
 
 
 
From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, 15 June 2022 7:42 pm

To: Pei Fang GOH (SPF) <GOH_Pei_Fang@spf.gov.sg>

Cc: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Request for Quotation - Mechanical Inspection of Prime Mover (Woodlands Division)
 
Hi IO
 
a) is correct.
b) contract of service is 1

Bryan Ang 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
 

On 15 Jun 2022, at 15:58, Pei Fang GOH (SPF) <GOH_Pei_Fang@spf.gov.sg> wrote:

Dear Sirs,
 
              My finance side would like to confirm the details of the purchase: -

a. Description of service: Buses and heavy vehicles (unladen weight exceeding
2500kg)

b. Contract no. of service:
 
Thank you very much.
 
 
Goh Pei Fang
Investigation Officer | GIS 1
Woodlands Division, Investigation Branch
DID: (65) 6736 0166
 
<image001.jpg>
Singapore Police Force    W police.gov.sg    FB fb.com/singaporepoliceforce    IG
Instagram.com/singaporepoliceforce

 
WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended
addressee, you must not copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any
information in this email to any unauthorized person is an offence under the Official Secrets Act 1935. Please
notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error.
 
 
 

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, 14 June 2022 7:02 pm

To: Pei Fang GOH (SPF) <GOH_Pei_Fang@spf.gov.sg>; Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto)
<SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Request for Quotation - Mechanical Inspection of Prime Mover (Woodlands
Division)
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Dear IO Pei Fang
 
Yes, we have an on-going period contract with MHA specific to mechanical inspection for
Traffic Police Department.
 
Best Regards,
Bryan Ang
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

From: Pei Fang GOH (SPF) <GOH_Pei_Fang@spf.gov.sg> 

Sent: Tuesday, 14 June 2022 8:49 am

To: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>;
Accounts (LKKAuto) <account@lkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Request for Quotation - Mechanical Inspection of Prime Mover (Woodlands
Division)
 
Dear Sherwin,
 
              May I confirm that this is a period contract?
 
2            I understand there is a ongoing contract with TP.
 
Thank you.
 
 
Goh Pei Fang
Investigation Officer | GIS 1
Woodlands Division, Investigation Branch
DID: (65) 6736 0166
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WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended
addressee, you must not copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any
information in this email to any unauthorized person is an offence under the Official Secrets Act 1935. Please
notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error.
 
 
 

From: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Monday, 30 May 2022 3:52 pm

To: Pei Fang GOH (SPF) <GOH_Pei_Fang@spf.gov.sg>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>;
Accounts (LKKAuto) <account@lkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Request for Quotation - Mechanical Inspection of Prime Mover (Woodlands
Division)
 
Dear IO Goh
 
I refer to your request below.
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We will carry out a mechanical inspection for any mechanical issue and additionally
focus on whether the prime mover can roll forward if the handbrake is fully and
properly engaged. A report of our findings will be put up thereafter for your further
action. 
 
Our fee is $700/- (excluding gst).
 
Do let us have your PO number to open a case on this.
 
Best Regards,
Sherwin Beh | Technical Investigator
 LKK Auto Consultants
Office: 6256 3561  | Email:  SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933)
 

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 30 May 2022 2:50 pm

To: Pei Fang GOH (SPF) <GOH_Pei_Fang@spf.gov.sg>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto)
<SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Request for Quotation - Mechanical Inspection of Prime Mover (Woodlands
Division)
 
Dear IO Goh
 
Thank for you’re the brief.
 
Dear Sherwin
 
Please quote on our fees. Inspection to check for any mechanical issue and additionally
to focus on whether prime mover can roll forward if handbrake is fully and properly
engaged.
 
Best Regards,
Bryan Ang
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
From: Pei Fang GOH (SPF) <GOH_Pei_Fang@spf.gov.sg> 

Sent: Friday, 27 May 2022 1:34 pm

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto)
<SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Request for Quotation - Mechanical Inspection of Prime Mover (Woodlands
Division)
 
Dear Bryan,
 
              The Prime Mover was stopped and the driver left it unattended at a driveway in the
Win5 compound. Subsequently, the Prime Mover then started to roll down the driveway and the
driver ran in front of it.
 
2            The Prime Mover collided onto the driver then rolled over the driver. The driver was
then pronounced dead on the spot. The Prime Mover continued to roll towards a bollard and
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stopped when it reached a metal railing.
 
3            It was observed that the Prime Mover engine was still running and the hand brake was
disengaged when PO and IO arrived.
 
4            Do let me know if you require other information.
 
Thank you.
 
 
Goh Pei Fang
Investigation Officer | GIS 1
Woodlands Division, Investigation Branch
DID: (65) 6736 0166
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addressee, you must not copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any
information in this email to any unauthorized person is an offence under the Official Secrets Act 1935. Please
notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error.
 
 
 
From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Friday, 27 May 2022 12:50 pm

To: Pei Fang GOH (SPF) <GOH_Pei_Fang@spf.gov.sg>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto)
<SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Request for Quotation - Mechanical Inspection of Prime Mover (Woodlands
Division)
 
Dear IO Goh
 
Can you provide a brief background on the case for us to carry out the appropriate inspection?


Dear Sherwin 
 
Please provide quote.

Bryan Ang 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
 

On 27 May 2022, at 11:39, Pei Fang GOH (SPF) <GOH_Pei_Fang@spf.gov.sg> wrote:

Dear Sir/Madam,
 
              I would like to request for a quotation for the mechanical inspection of a
Prime Mover (Registration plate: XD1081D) involved in a fatal road accident.
 
2            The Prime Mover is currently at the Traffic Police compound.
 
Thank you.
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Goh Pei Fang
Investigation Officer | GIS 1
Woodlands Division, Investigation Branch
DID: (65) 6736 0166
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not the intended addressee, you must not copy, distribute or take any action in reliance
thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is an
offence under the Official Secrets Act 1935. Please notify the sender immediately if you receive
this in error.
 


