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Yan (LKK Auto)

From: SPF LOGS ACS (SPF) <SPF_LOGS_ACS@spf.gov.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 28 June 2022 1:11 PM
To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); assignments
Cc: Cui Fen ENG (SPF); Lai Kuen LUI (SPF); Hang Jia AW (SPF)
Subject: Pre-Repair Survey on SMW1022E (Accident with QX1724K, DOA: 25.06.22)
Attachments: SMW1022E.pdf; SKM_558e22062810222.tif

Our ref: ACS/105/009/2022/039 
 
Dear LKK, 
 
              Kindly arrange PRS of SMW1022E at 
 

Performance Motors Ltd 
303 Alexandra Road, Singapore 159941 
Tel: 6319 0175 

 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Hafizul Farhan Bin Rahmat 
Assistant Logistics Support Officer 
Corporate Services Division | Police Logistics Department 
DID: 6842 8429 

 
Singapore Police Force    W police.gov.sg    FB fb.com/singaporepoliceforce    IG 
Instagram.com/singaporepoliceforce 

 
WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not 
copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is an 
offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error”. 

 

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 28 June 2022 11:16 am 
To: SPF LOGS ACS (SPF) <SPF_LOGS_ACS@spf.gov.sg> 
Cc: Chua Kee Sin <chua.kee.sin@simedarby.com.sg>; Cresendo Llurca Lagman <cresendo.lagman@simedarby.com.sg>; 
Toh Jing Xuan <toh.jing.xuan@simedarby.com.sg>; Cui Fen ENG (SPF) <ENG_Cui_Fen@spf.gov.sg>; Lai Kuen LUI (SPF) 



2

<LUI_Lai_Kuen@spf.gov.sg> 
Subject: Re: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT SMW1022E AND QX1724K ON 25.06.22 
 
Dear Mr.Shafizul, 
 
Please find attached for GIA report and insurance certificate. Currently owner is utilising the vehicle, meanwhile advise if 
agreeable for direct settlement.   
 

Thank you. 

  

Best regard, 

  

 

Bodyshop 

  

BMW 

Performance Motors Ltd 

  

DDI: +65 6319 0175 

FAX: +65 6479 4601 

Address: 303 Alexandra Road, Singapore 159941 

Email: pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg 

  

www.bmw.com.sg 

  

 

Sime Darby Motors 

A member of the Sime Darby Group 
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From: SPF LOGS ACS (SPF) <SPF_LOGS_ACS@spf.gov.sg> 
Sent: Tuesday, 28 June 2022 10:52 am 
To: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg> 
Cc: Chua Kee Sin <chua.kee.sin@simedarby.com.sg>; Cresendo Llurca Lagman <cresendo.lagman@simedarby.com.sg>; 
Toh Jing Xuan <toh.jing.xuan@simedarby.com.sg>; Cui Fen ENG (SPF) <ENG_Cui_Fen@spf.gov.sg>; Lai Kuen LUI (SPF) 
<LUI_Lai_Kuen@spf.gov.sg> 
Subject: RE: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT SMW1022E AND QX1724K ON 25.06.22  
  
  
CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organisation. Do not click links or open attachments unless 
you recognise the sender and know the content is safe. Click “Report Phishing” if you think it is malicious. 
   
Dear Sir, 
  
              Kindly submit the GIA report and the vehicle Certificate of insurance. 
  
              We would like to arrange for the Pre-repair survey of SMW1022E. 
  
              Thank you. 
  
  
Best Regards, 
  
Hafizul Farhan Bin Rahmat 
Assistant Logistics Support Officer 
Corporate Services Division | Police Logistics Department 
DID: 6842 8429 

 
Singapore Police Force    W police.gov.sg    FB fb.com/singaporepoliceforce    IG 
Instagram.com/singaporepoliceforce 
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WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not 
copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is an 
offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error”. 
  

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 28 June 2022 9:31 am 
To: SPF LOGS ACS (SPF) <SPF_LOGS_ACS@spf.gov.sg> 
Cc: Chua Kee Sin <chua.kee.sin@simedarby.com.sg>; Cresendo Llurca Lagman <cresendo.lagman@simedarby.com.sg>; 
Toh Jing Xuan <toh.jing.xuan@simedarby.com.sg> 
Subject: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT SMW1022E AND QX1724K ON 25.06.22 
  
Dear Sirs, 

  

Refer to the above matter. 
 
Attached are the estimate and supporting documents for your consideration. 

Please advise if liability is clear for us to proceed with Direct Settlement. 

  
Thank you. 

  

Best regard, 

  

Inthiran  

  

Bodyshop 

  

BMW 

Performance Motors Ltd 

  

DDI: +65 6319 0175 
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FAX: +65 6479 4601 

Address: 303 Alexandra Road, Singapore 159941 

Email: pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg 

  

www.bmw.com.sg 

  

  

Sime Darby Motors 

A member of the Sime Darby Group 

  
“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the named 
addressee ("the Recipient") and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or proprietary to the Sime 
Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws. If you are not the intended 
Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding and/or printing the Message. Please notify 
the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete all copies of the Message. Sime Darby disclaims all 
liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the Message being infected by computer virus or other malicious 
software. Any views and/or opinions expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and do not necessarily 
represent those of Sime Darby's.”  


