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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 12 October 2022 8:55 AM

To: Thomas Pang   PTCBC

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

Subject: Finalize Report SKC7177G

Attachments: SKC 7177 main estimate and supp1.pdf; JAE price.png; 18072022132251-0001.pdf

Hi Thomas, 

 

Kindly inform as per Insurance instruction re-check the price from JAE auto. We are unable finalize this 

case. We will submit our own report. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Thanks. 

 
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Thomas Pang PTCBC <Thomas.Pang@borneomotors.com.sg> 

Sent: Thursday, 6 October 2022 1:35 pm 

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Finalize Report SKC7177G  

  

Dear Steve, 

 

Any update on the finalization? 

 

Thank you 

 

Regards 

 

Thomas pang 

 

-----Original Message----- 

From: Thomas Pang PTCBC  
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Sent: Tuesday, 16 August 2022 10:06 am 

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: Finalize Report SKC7177G 

 

Hi, 

 

Attach finalize report for your perusal. 

 

Thank you 

 

Regards 

 

Thomas Pang 

 

-----Original Message----- 

From: Thomas Pang PTCBC  

Sent: Monday, 18 July 2022 1:26 pm 

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Finalize Report SKC7177G 

 

Dear Steve, 

 

Attach finalize report for your perusal. 

 

Thank you 

 

Regards 

 

Thomas Pang 


