Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: HD Perfect Autowork <hdperfectautowork@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 21 September 2022 1:07 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SJA9397Y (Finalise)

Dear Taufikh,

Thanks for finalising the said case with us.

We are agreeable to accept the COR at $5,900.00 and 07 working days.

Thank You.

Regards,

Irene

Mobile: 8297 9787

HD Perfect Autowork Pte. Ltd.
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #08-09
Premier @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 415875

On Wed, Sep 21, 2022 at 12:31 PM Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Shanelle,

COR I/s $5900, 7 days.

Subject to insurance approval.

Regards

Taufikh



Lkk Auto

From: HD Perfect Autowork [mailto:hdperfectautowork@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, 15 July 2022 2:27 PM

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com

Subject: Re: SJA9397Y (Finalise)

Dear Taufikh,

Any update on the finalisation ?

Thank You.

Regards,

Shanelle Lim

Mobile: 8297 9787

HD Perfect Autowork Pte. Ltd.
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #08-09
Premier @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 415875

On Fri, Jul 1, 2022 at 4:21 PM HD Perfect Autowork <hdperfectautowork@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Taufikh,

Please refer to the attached document and after repair photos.

Can we close the case at $6,700.00 and 07 working days?



Thank You.

Regards,

Irene

Mobile: 8297 9787

HD Perfect Autowork Pte. Ltd.
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #08-09
Premier @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 415875



