Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Harminder Kaur <Harminder@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 20 June 2022 9:45 AM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com; Lim Gan Koon (Chris)

Cc: Wahhong motors & credit pte Itd

Subject: FW: NON REPORTING D22001862MFVS/PTE/CL - Accident involving vehicle no.
SDS760S and XE1443M on 17/06/2022

Attachments: SW0C226H0003_17-06-2022_160129.pdf; MTO0015198 is Approved (4.96 KB); MSA.pdf

Dear Sirs,

Enclosed is our survey assignment.
Thank You.

Best Regards,
Harminder Kaur
Motor Claims

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd
A Member of EEEEEH Insurance Group

36 Robinson Road, #16-01 City House, Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | Fax: 6507 3849 |Reg. No. 195000106C

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error,
please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.

From: Wah Hong motors & credit pte ltd <motor@wahhong.sg>

Sent: Friday, June 17, 2022 4:16 PM

To: Motor Claims <MotorClaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: Liability Check - Accident involving vehicle no. SDS760S and XE1443M on 17/06/2022

Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the above subject and we acting for the owner of SDS760S against your insured vehicle XE1443M.

Kindly update us that have your insured XE1443M file a report? If yes, please let us know your confirmation on liability
for the above accident.

Please be informed that our client has yet to leave their vehicle to our premises for claim, however we have our client’s
instructions to check liability for the above matter.

Kindly let us have your reply, we have attached the GIA report for your perusal.



Thank You and Best Regards,

Jenny Ng

Admin Manager

WAH HONG MOTORS & CREDIT PTE LTD
ROC:199806235M

ENTERPRISE HUB
38 TOH GUAN ROAD EAST
#01-57 S(608581)

Tel: (65) 6773 7377

HP: (69) 8778 3555
Website: www.wahhong.sg
Mail: motor@wahhong.sg
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CONFIDENTIAL NOTE: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named abowe
contain information that is privilesed, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you hav
this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete the mail.

Data Privacy Policy Notice: Wah Hong Motor & Credit Pte. Lid. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes sta
Privacy Policy.

This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom disclosure is permitted /required by
third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf).



