Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 29 December 2022 2:30 PM
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: Please finalise SLR3717J (claim ECICS)

From: Grace Tan <Grace@Ricardo.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 29 December 2022 2:29:40 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Please finalise SLR3717] (claim ECICS)

Hi Rasul,
$3177.90 for SLR3717J is confirmed. Thanks.

Kind Regards,

Grace Tan
Ricardo Auto Centre Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive #02-02/03
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

T: 6475 2112 (Main)
6460 9542 (DID)

F: 6475 4666

W: www.ricardo.com.sg

Save Paper. Save the Earth. Think twice before you print.

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 29 December 2022 2:19 pm

To: Grace Tan <Grace@Ricardo.com.sg>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Please finalise SLR3717J (claim ECICS)

Hi Grace
We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $3,177.90 /- with 04 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Kindly acknowledge

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

=] Save the Larth- FPrint only when necessary-

From: Grace Tan <Grace@Ricardo.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 22 December 2022 11:20 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Please finalise SLR3717J (claim ECICS)

Hi Rasul,
Attached as per request.

Kind Regards,

Grace Tan
Ricardo Auto Centre Pte Ltd



160 Sin Ming Drive #02-02/03
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

T: 6475 2112 (Main)
6460 9542 (DID)

F: 6475 4666

W: www.ricardo.com.sg

Save Paper. Save the Earth. Think twice before you print.

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 22 December 2022 9:41 am

To: Grace Tan <Grace@Ricardo.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Please finalise SLR3717J (claim ECICS)

Hi Grace,

kindly email me the supplementary copy

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Ky Save the ELarth- Print only whenr necessary-

From: Grace Tan <Grace@Ricardo.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 20 December 2022 12:52 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: Please finalise SLR3717J (claim ECICS)

Hi Rasul,

Attached b4 paint pictures for your perusal.

Please finalise part by part.

Don’t forget the supplementary items (front number plate n break seal labour)
Thanks.

Kind Regards,

Grace Tan
Ricardo Auto Centre Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive #02-02/03
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

T: 6475 2112 (Main)
6460 9542 (DID)

F: 6475 4666

W: www.ricardo.com.sg

Save Paper. Save the Earth. Think twice before you print.

From: Grace Tan

Sent: Tuesday, 20 December 2022 10:00 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Please finalise SLR3717)J (claim ECICS)

Morning Rasul,

One supplementary items omitted.
This car do part by part, not lumpsum basis.

Kind Regards,

Grace Tan
Ricardo Auto Centre Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive #02-02/03
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722



T: 6475 2112 (Main)
6460 9542 (DID)

F: 6475 4666

W: www.ricardo.com.sg

Save Paper. Save the Earth. Think twice before you print.

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 20 December 2022 9:55 am

To: Grace Tan <Grace@Ricardo.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Please finalise SLR3717J (claim ECICS)

Hi Grace,
Refer to attachment

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $2,450.00 /- with 04 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Kindly acknowledge

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth- Print only whenr necessary-

From: Grace Tan <Grace@Ricardo.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 19 December 2022 2:35 pm
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: Please finalise SLR3717J (claim ECICS)

Hi Rasul,
Attached fyr. Thanks.

Kind Regards,

Grace Tan
Ricardo Auto Centre Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive #02-02/03
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

T: 6475 2112 (Main)
6460 9542 (DID)

F: 6475 4666

W: www.ricardo.com.sg

Save Paper. Save the Earth. Think twice before you print.

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 19 December 2022 11:30 am

To: Grace Tan <Grace@Ricardo.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Please finalise SLR3717J (claim ECICS)

Hi Grace,

Kindly email me the after repair photos

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth- Print only wherr necessary-

From: Grace Tan <Grace@Ricardo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 12 December 2022 12:31 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Please finalise SLR3717J (claim ECICS)

Hi Rasul,

Hope you getting well!
Please finalise above asap, we do part by part. Thanks.

Kind Regards,

Grace Tan
Ricardo Auto Centre Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive #02-02/03
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

T: 6475 2112 (Main)
6460 9542 (DID)

F: 6475 4666

W: www.ricardo.com.sg

Save Paper. Save the Earth. Think twice before you print.



