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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 26 April 2023 3:21 PM

To: Carrine Leong

Cc: 'Boo seng yak'; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; 'Chang Chee Sing'; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SKL7605R - TP STRIKES AUTO - SURVEYED 24 JUN 22

Attachments: SKL 7605R marking.pdf; PA05092022 - SKL 7605 R - AUDI Q5 2.0 TFSI QU - REAR - SMRT (TP).xlsx

Hi Carrine, 

 

COR $8045 , 3 days. 

 

Subject to insurance approval. 

 

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 

 

 

From: Carrine Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, April 19, 2023 11:59 AM 

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'Boo seng yak' <boojohnny@gmail.com>; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; 'Chang Chee Sing' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SKL7605R - TP STRIKES AUTO - SURVEYED 24 JUN 22 

 
Hi Taufikh, 

 

Reminder  

 

Revised estimate and photographs attached. 

 

Please confirm repair cost of $ 8045.00 @ 3 days. 

 

Your early closure is appreciated. 

 

 

 

 

 
Thanks & Best Regard 

Carrine Leong  

Claims Administrator 

 
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd  (Reg No 199902271W) 

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699 

p. +65 6388 2323  d. +65 6768 9925  f. +65 6841 1183  

e. carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg   w. www.audi.com.sg 

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre  281 Alexandra Road   Singapore 159938  p. +65 6836 2223 

 
 

From: Carrine Leong [mailto:carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 27 March 2023 12:38 pm 

To: 'taufikh@lkkauto.com' <taufikh@lkkauto.com>; 'CS A Team' <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'Boo seng yak' <boojohnny@gmail.com>; 'jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg' <jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg>; 'Chang Chee Sing' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SKL7605R - TP STRIKES AUTO - SURVEYED 24 JUN 22 

 
Hi Taufikh, 

 

Reminder  

 

Revised estimate and photographs attached. 

 

Please confirm repair cost of $ 8045.00 @ 3 days. 

 

Your early closure is appreciated. 
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Thanks & Best Regard 

Carrine Leong  

Claims Administrator 

 
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd  (Reg No 199902271W) 

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699 

p. +65 6388 2323  d. +65 6768 9925  f. +65 6841 1183  

e. carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg   w. www.audi.com.sg 

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre  281 Alexandra Road   Singapore 159938  p. +65 6836 2223 

 
 

From: Boo seng yak [mailto:boojohnny@gmail.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 30 August 2022 4:21 pm 

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Carrine Leong 

<carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Chang Chee Sing <claims@premiumauto.com.sg> 

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SKL7605R - TP STRIKES AUTO - SURVEYED 24 JUN 22 

 
Hi Taufikh and all, 
 
Revised estimate and photographs attached. 
 
Please confirm repair cost of $ 8045.00 @ 3 days. 
 
Your early closure is well appreciated. 
 
 
Best regards - Johnny Boo 


