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Yan (LKK Auto)

From: MTPRI <MTPRI@smrt.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 21 June 2022 12:04 PM
To: assignments; admin-a@lkkauto.com
Cc: MTPRI; Magnaye Ana Margie Marasigan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd)
Subject: FW: Third Party Survey - SJA6505Y Your Insured - SHB5760B  D.O.A - 17.06.2022
Attachments: SJA6505Y Estimate.pdf

Ref: TAX/06/22/2053 
 
Dear Yan, 
 
Kindly survey on “ Without Prejudice” basis. 
 
TP: SJA6505Y 
Insured: SHB5760B 
Workshop: Tan Lim Motor Pte Ltd 
 
Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
 
Hua Yen 
Claim Department 
 
Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd | 60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4 Singapore 757705 

DID: 6866 2650 | Fax: 6368 7421 | Email: HuaYen.Ong@strides.com.sg 
 

From: wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg <wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg>  
Sent: Saturday, 18 June 2022 12:06 pm 
To: MTPRI <MTPRI@smrt.com.sg> 
Cc: frontdesk@tlmotor.com.sg; sharon.ten@tlmotor.com.sg; Karen Chan Siau Chin (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) 
<SiauChin.Chan@strides.com.sg>; Tan Wei Teck (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <WeiTeck.Tan@strides.com.sg>; 
Foo Chit Yan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <ChitYan.Foo@strides.com.sg> 
Subject: Third Party Survey - SJA6505Y Your Insured - SHB5760B D.O.A - 17.06.2022 
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of SMRT. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender and 
are expecting the content or attachment.  

Your Ref: SHB5760B 
 
Our Ref: SJA6505Y 
 
DOA: 17.06.2022 
 
Without Prejudice 

Dear All, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We enclose the following documents for your attention:- 
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a. Copy of SAS report – Password SJA6505Y9186J 
b. Estimate cost of repair. 

 
In addition, please confirm in writing whether you are agreeable to direct settle with us at 100% liability for this 
case. 
  
We await for your favourable reply. 
 
Please arrange survey as soon as possible. 
 
 
Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
 

 

Lam Wei Shong 
William 
wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg 

 
O.    +65 6858 5151  
F.     +65 6858 0877  

Tan Lim Motor Pte Ltd 
1 Defu Lane 6 
Singapore 539365 
http://www.tlmotor.com.sg 

Confidentiality Notice: This email (including any attachments) is intended for the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is confidential to Tan Lim Motor 
Pte Ltd. Any use of the information (including,but not limited to, total or partial reproduction, distribution or dissemination in any form) by persons other than the intended 
recipient(s) is prohibited. If you are not an intended recipient of this email, please notify the sender immediately and delete it. While Tan Lim Motor has put in place anti-virus 
programs, we do not accept responsibility for any damage caused by viruses passed on unwittingly. 
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