Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Darren Ng <claims@teamworkgarage.com>
Sent: Friday, 25 November 2022 11:26 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: RE: SKP570G TOYOTA 86

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Veron,
We confirmed amount.

Regards

Darren

68442475

BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK
UBI AVE 1 #01-24

S(408934)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 24 November 2022 12:02 pm
To: Darren Ng; SUR

Subject: RE: SKP570G TOYOTA 86

Dear Darren,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $11,000/- with 7 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Darren Ng <claims@teamworkgarage.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 22 November 2022 9:21 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SKP570G TOYOTA 86

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Veron,

Please revise and get back to us soonest.



Regards

Darren

68442475

BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK
UBI AVE 1 #01-24

S(408934)

From: Darren Ng
Sent: Wednesday, 2 November 2022 2:46 pm

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: RE: SKP570G TOYOTA 86

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Veron,
Is there any update ?

Regards

Darren

68442475

BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK
UBI AVE 1 #01-24

S(408934)

From: Darren Ng
Sent: Thursday, 27 October 2022 9:50 am

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: RE: SKP570G TOYOTA 86

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Veron,
Is there any update for this case?

Regards

Darren

68442475

BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK
UBI AVE 1 #01-24

S(408934)

From: Darren Ng
Sent: Monday, 26 September 2022 10:31 am

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: RE: SKP570G TOYOTA 86

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Veron,
Is there any update for this?

Regards



Darren

68442475

BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK
UBI AVE 1 #01-24

S(408934)

From: Darren Ng

Sent: Friday, 23 September 2022 9:55 am
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: RE: SKP570G TOYOTA 86

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Veron,
Please refer to attached.

Regards

Darren

68442475

BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK
UBI AVE 1 #01-24

S(408934)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 23 September 2022 9:26 am

To: Darren Ng; SUR
Subject: RE: SKP570G TOYOTA 86

Dear Darren,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Attach marking

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Darren Ng <claims@teamworkgarage.com>

Sent: Thursday, 22 September 2022 4:50 PM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SKP570G TOYOTA 86
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Veron,

Can | have the revised marking?




Regards

Darren

68442475

BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK
UBI AVE 1 #01-24

S(408934)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 22 September 2022 4:03 pm

To: Darren Ng; SUR
Subject: RE: SKP570G TOYOTA 86

Dear Darren,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $10,700/- with 7 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Darren Ng <claims@teamworkgarage.com>
Sent: Monday, 19 September 2022 11:21 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SKP570G TOYOTA 86

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Veron,
Any update for this case?

Regards

Darren

68442475

BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK
UBI AVE 1 #01-24

S(408934)

From: Darren Ng
Sent: Wednesday, 14 September 2022 10:13 am

To: SUR
Subject: SKP570G TOYOTA 86
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Veron,



Please refer to attached 5 items that | would like to counter-propose.
Feel free to call me for verification.

Regards

Darren

68442475

BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK
UBI AVE 1 #01-24

S(408934)



