Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Galaxy <claims8488galaxy@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 6 January 2023 2:51 PM
To: Finalization
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: SDZ7755A Finalize
Hi All,
Ok Accept
Alex Beh
On 5/1/2023 6:00 pm, Finalization wrote:
Hi Alex,

We will be advising our principal for the costs of repairs in $3050.00 (L/S, before GST), 6 days. Subject to their approval.

Thanks

Best Regards,
Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: galaxy <claims8488galaxy@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 18 October 2022 3:57 PM

To: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: SDZ7755A LOD Accident on 20.06.2022

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear All,
Hope this email finds you well.
Kindly let us have your proposed offer soonest.

Thank you

Regards

Alex

GALAXY AUTO CARE PTE LTD



