Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 21 June 2022 5:09 PM

To: Jenny Lim

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: LKK/veh IN \ CMTD2202123/AGC - Request for Survey (OD) - SGN1644D /

Toyota Estima - Date of Accident: 17.06.2022

Dear Sir,
As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SGN1644D (Excess Wavied).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their rights_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.
Repair on Part by Part, invoice to present upon finlaise.

If repair change to lump sum please let us know and will inform insurance again.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@Iaihuat.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, June 20, 2022 5:23 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurvey@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: Request for Survey (OD) - SGN 1644D / Toyota Estima - Date of Accident: 17.06.2022

CAUTION: This Email is from an EXTERNAL source. Ensure you trust this sender (Email) before replying or clicking on
any links and open attachments.

Dear Sir

We refer to the above matter.

Please can you arrange to survey our mutual client’s vehicle no. SGN 1644D tomorrow?
The vehicle is in workshop and supporting documents are enclosed for your reference.

Thank you.



Kind regards.

Jenny Lim

for LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD
160 Sin Ming Drive

#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03

Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 64538110

Fax: 64596267



