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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Autosoon Soon <autosoon1@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 21 September 2022 11:43 AM

To: Autosoon Soon; Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: EQ1101L_Soo; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: EQ 1101L

 

Hi Rasul, 

 

Thank you very much and we agreed to this amount and hope ur client could accept to settle this amount. 

 

Thanks and regards, 

Soon 

On Wed, 21 Sep 2022 at 10:53 AM, Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Boss, 
  

As spoken request approved. 
 

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $3,000.00 /- with 03 day of 

repair, subject to their approval. 

 

 
Best Regards,  

Rasul | Assessor  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  

 

From: Autosoon Soon <autosoon1@gmail.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, 20 September 2022 2:13 pm 

To: Autosoon Soon <autosoon1@gmail.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; EQ1101L_Soo <flexuro@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: EQ 1101L  

  

Hi Rasul, 

 

Thanks and appreciated your kind offer for these damaged repairs. 

 

We have already billed our client for $4800 with GST and were paid  

the full amount for the repair, since 25/05/2022. 

 

We would appreciate it if you could kindly assist our client with this  

matter, since new parts were used in the repair.  

 

We would sincerely hope you could increase the lump sum to $3,000  
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for our client, in this hit-and-run case involving your client insured, our 

client is agreeable to settle the said amount without further reference 

to his solicitors to issue the writ of summons to your client and insured. 

 

Look forward to your kind cooperation and hope to finalize the repairs  

cost at $3,000 before GST and we are for only 2 days of repair. 

 

Thanks and regards, 

Soon 

 

 
 

 

On Tue, 20 Sep 2022 at 11:42 AM, Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Boss, 
  

refer to attachment 

 

We unable to include parts that was raise in the estimate due to shortage of damage 

photos. Anyway, we will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $2,700.00 /- 

with 03 days of repair, subject to their approval. 

 

 
Best Regards,  

Rasul | Assessor  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  

 


