Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 4 August 2023 11:07 AM
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Winnie Chai (via Google Drive); SUR
Subject: Re: Finalization for PC8885E

Hi Shiau Chan,

Ok. please process

Thank you

Ms Lau

Tel: 8188 4136

Connect 3

566 Woodlands Road
(Mandai Estate) S 728697

On Fri, Aug 4, 2023 at 11:03 AM Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Ms Lau,

Without prejudice

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of $2,200.00 before with 2 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, July 31, 2023 11:01 AM
To: Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com>; Winnie Chai (via Google Drive) <connect3winnie@gmail.com>; Finalization
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<finalization@Ikkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Finalization for PC8885E

Dear Lau,

Thank you for the email.

Dear Shiau Chan,

Please assist. Your Ref: CS/CT122005848/Eqy3q2

Best Regards,
Celine Fong
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, July 28, 2023 5:43 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>; Winnie Chai (via Google Drive) <connect3winnie@gmail.com>
Subject: Finalization for PC8885E

Hi Celine,



This case is under Steve. understand he is no longer in LKK.

Attached is the after repair photos.

PlIs kindly revert on the finalization.

Thank you

Ms Lau

Tel: 8188 4136
Connect 3

566 Woodlands Road

(Mandai Estate) S 728697



