Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Woo Ryan <scoryan@hotmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 7 July 2022 10:57 am

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: Fw: Accident Involving SG5823Y on 27 May 2022 Ref: 2205-05054-01
Dear Cecilia,

As spoken just now, please see the quote sent to me for the repair, loss of use and etc for the bus. I'm sending
you this to assist with your claims assessment. Hopefully, the final claim amount will not be more than this
amount quoted. Please update me of the finalised claim amount AIG will be paying.

Thanks & hope to hear from you soon.

Ryan Woo
86994599

From: Tan Wei Teck (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <WeiTeck.Tan@strides.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, June 3, 2022 5:52 PM

To: scoryan@hotmail.com <scoryan@hotmail.com>

Cc: Karen Chan Siau Chin (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <SiauChin.Chan@strides.com.sg>
Subject: Accident Involving SG5823Y on 27 May 2022 Ref : 2205-05054-01

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Ryan,

We refer to the above matter and our losses are as follows:-

Labour $530.00
Painting $262.00
Advertisement $480.00
Loss of use (2 days @ $350.00/day) $700.00
Total $1972.00

Kindly let us hear from you soon, thanks.
Regards

Patrick Toarv

Claims and Insurance Agency

Direct line +65 6556 3522 | WeiTeck.Tan@Strides.com.sg
60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4

Singapore 757705




