
 
 
 
Your Ref: CY 22/MID22002/310522/0020 
Our Ref: CC2/MIDA22005773/p        
 
 

 
 
 

HQ-Transport Command 
Kranji Camp 3 
151 Choa Chu Kang Way 
Singapore 688248 
 
 

Attn : Maj Edwin 
 
 

Dear Sirs, 
 
 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES MID 22002 & YP 1043P ON 31/05/2022 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We have notified NTUC that MID will not pursue claim against them. Attached herewith 
all the relevant documents for your easy reference. 
 
We have completed the claims activities and shall close our file. 
 
Our note of charges is enclosed for your necessary action. 
 
 
Yours faithfully 
 
 
 
 
Chew Hsiao Tong 
Claims Section 
DID: 6742 3197 
E-mail: chewht@lkkauto.com 
 



TAX INVOICE

INV No.

INV Date 07/11/2022

AC2206713

Description Total 

Documentation For Motor Accident Claim     40.00

Corresponding With TP Insurer For Recovery OR Settlement (If TCA  
Applicable)

120.00

Conduct Searches & Purchase Report at Third-Party Government Agencies 1.87

Subtotal 161.87

GST (7%) 11.33

Grand Total 173.20

MINISTRY OF DEFENCE

HQ TRANSPORT COMMAND 
KRANJI CAMP 3
151 CHOA CHU KANG WAY
SINGAPORE 688248

Code MIDA

We shall be glad if you could forward the payment at your early convenience.

Cheque should be crossed and made payable to 'LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd'

PROFESSIONAL SERVICE FEE

Vehicle No. MID 22002

Insured Veh.

Claim No. CY 22/MID22002/310522/0020

Policy No. OA22008919

Accident Date 31/05/2022

Inspection Date

Reference CC2/MIDA22005773/p

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

CHT

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R  GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R



  
    

    DATE OF ISSUE OF IOD:  13 JUN 22                                     IOD NO: CY 22/MID22002/310522/0020 
  

     TO: HSIAO TONG & JASLIN / 6256 3561                      
    LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD              

Instrument of demand to engage the services of an insurance Claims Adjuster (Period 
Contract No: (DEF000ETT21000043)   

UNIT/ HUB  
DATE OF 

ACCIDENT  MID & CIVILIAN INFORMATION  REMARK  

 1 TPT 
BN/KRANJI 

NODE  

31/05/22 
1015HRS  

VEH NO  

CIVILIAN  MILITARY  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING  
MILITARY VEHICLE MID 22002  
AND CIVILIAN LORRY YP 1043P 
ON 31 MAY 2022 AT AROUND 
1015 HRS ALONG THE 
JUNCTION OF YISHUN AVENUE 
1 AND MANDAI ROAD  

YP 1043P MID 22002 

DRIVER NRIC  -  SXXXX933Z  

DRIVER 
NAME  - 

LCP ABELLANA JAN 
REZ CASINILLO 

DAMAGE TO 
VEHICLE  

Unknown  
Paint chipped on 

RHS of the vehicle.  

Requesting Officer                                                            
                                                                                                                                                       DATE: ______________________________  
      
    OA: ________________________________  
                                                                                       
(SIGNATURE)                                                      GRA: _______________________________  
MAJ EDWIN KANG      
HD Traffic Accident Investigation   
& Education Sect  
HQ Transport  



    
  
  

FOR INFO:  

  



7/4/22, 11:52 AM Insurer Enquiry — GEARS

https://www.gears.com.sg/insurer-enquiry 1/1

INSURER ENQUIRY

Find
insurer
Vehicle reg. no.

YP1043P

Date of Accident

RESULT & RECEIPT

Payment details
Request Amount: S$1.87
GST Amount: S$0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive): S$2

General Insurance Association
Records Management Centre
GST Registration No: M400017735

31/05/2022

Reset

TP Insurer Enquiry

Insurance NTUC Income Insurance Co-op…

Period of Insurance 03/09/2021 - 02/09/2022

Requested By Chew Hsiao Tong (National As…

Requested Date 04/07/2022 11:52

.........................................................................

.......................................................................

...............................................................

....................................................................................................
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: MTCL@income.com.sg
Sent: Friday, 30 September 2022 6:31 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID22002 & YP1043P ALONG YISHUN AVE 1 ON 

31/05/2022

Classification: Restricted  
 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
This is noted. 
 
Thank you 
 
 
* In view of the stricter measures impose on the Covid-19 situation, we would strongly request you to email all claims 
document to us at mtcl@income.com.sg so that we can attend to it. You may wish to know that we would not be 
able to receive any documents send to our office at Trade Union House or any of our branches during this period. 
 
 
With Regards 
 

Joreen Ang 
Senior Admin Assistant 
Operations, Motor & Personal Lines 
 
  

 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 30 September 2022 11:06 AM 
To: MTCL@income.com.sg 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID22002 & YP1043P ALONG YISHUN AVE 1 ON 31/05/2022 
 
REMINDER 
 
Your Ref: YP1043P                                                         Without Prejudice 
LKK Ref: CC2/MIDA22005773/p 
 
M/s NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID22002 & YP1043P ALONG YISHUN AVE 1 ON 31/05/2022 
 
We have been appointed by MINDEF as claims adjuster to handle all traffic accident claims involving military 
vehicles with effect from December 2021. 
 
The accident was caused due to the negligence of your insured by cutting lane and collided onto our vehicle 
MID22002.  
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We would like to inform you that there is no repair for MID vehicle as the damage is very fine and not required for 
repair work. Therefore, MID will not pursue claim against your insured for this matter and will proceed to close file. 
 
Please acknowledge receipt. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Friday, 29 July 2022 2:00 PM 
To: motor@income.com.sg 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID22002 & YP1043P ALONG YISHUN AVE 1 ON 31/05/2022 
 
Your Ref: YP1043P                                                         Without Prejudice 
LKK Ref: CC2/MIDA22005773/p 
 
M/s NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID22002 & YP1043P ALONG YISHUN AVE 1 ON 31/05/2022 
 
We have been appointed by MINDEF as claims adjuster to handle all traffic accident claims involving military 
vehicles with effect from December 2021. 
 
The accident was caused due to the negligence of your insured by cutting lane and collided onto our vehicle 
MID22002.  
 
We would like to inform you that there is no repair for MID vehicle as the damage is very fine and not required for 
repair work. Therefore, MID will not pursue claim against your insured for this matter and will proceed to close file. 
 
Please acknowledge receipt. 
 
Thank you. 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

Disclaimer  
This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s) 
named above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies 
of it. Thank you. 
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 1 November 2022 10:55 AM
To: HO AIK SENG, DENNIS (MINDEF)
Cc: EDWIN KANG WEE HUAT (MINDEF); RISHABH RADHAKRISHNAN (MINDEF); Olivia 

Lau (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: MID 22002 FCOR 
Attachments: EMAIL FROM NTUC_ACK DD 300922.pdf

Dear Sirs, 
 
We have notify NTUC that MID will not pursue claim against them. Attached herewith a copy of acknowledgement 
email from NTUC for your easy reference. 
 
We will proceed to close file and submit invoice to your good office. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: HO AIK SENG, DENNIS (MINDEF) <HO_Aik_Seng_Dennis@defence.gov.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 30 June 2022 11:48 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: EDWIN KANG WEE HUAT (MINDEF) <KANG_Wee_Huat_Edwin@defence.gov.sg>; RISHABH RADHAKRISHNAN 
(MINDEF) <Rishabh_Radhakrishnan@defence.gov.sg>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: MID 22002 FCOR  
 
Message Classification: Official Closed  
Hi Hisao Tong, 
 

1. This case there is no repair by our workshop as the damage is very fine and not required. That’s why the 
ECOR is only Zero. 

 
2. The intent we have is to registered to the insurer first to notify this matter official instead of 3rd party claim 

against us instead in pro-active mode. 
 

3. We can discuss again on this how it should be done in order to closure case smoothly without leaving any 
aftermath issues. 

 
         DENNIS HO 
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TA INVESTIGATION WO 
SAFETY BRANCH, HQ TPT 
           63074511 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: 30 June, 2022 10:38 AM 
To: HO AIK SENG, DENNIS (MINDEF) <HO_Aik_Seng_Dennis@defence.gov.sg> 
Cc: EDWIN KANG WEE HUAT (MINDEF) <KANG_Wee_Huat_Edwin@defence.gov.sg>; RISHABH RADHAKRISHNAN 
(MINDEF) <Rishabh_Radhakrishnan@defence.gov.sg>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: MID 22002 FCOR  
 
Message Classification: Official Closed  
Dear Sirs, 
 
According SAF report, the accident was caused by the negligence driving of civilian driver by cutting into our SAF’s 
lane and hit onto MID vehicle. 
 
We are intending to submit recovery claim against civilian insurer. 
 
Kindly assist to confirm if there is any FCOR for this matter as ECOR submitted is $0.00.  
 
Thank you. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Wednesday, 22 June 2022 12:48 PM 
To: RISHABH RADHAKRISHNAN <Rishabh_Radhakrishnan@defence.gov.sg> 
Subject: RE: MID 22002 FCOR 
 
Hi Rish, 
 
Received with thanks. 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: RISHABH RADHAKRISHNAN (MINDEF) <Rishabh_Radhakrishnan@defence.gov.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 22 June 2022 11:28 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: MID 22002 FCOR 
 
Message Classification: Official Closed  
Hi Hsiao Tong, 
 
Please see attached the FCOR for MID 22002. 
 
Thanks, 
Rishabh 

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this 
message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not copy, 
distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any 
information in this email to any unauthorised person is an offence under  
the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately  
if you receive this in error." 

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this 
message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not copy, 
distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any 
information in this email to any unauthorised person is an offence under  
the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately  
if you receive this in error." 



OFFICIAL (CLOSED) \ SENSITIVE NORMAL 

1 

OFFICIAL (CLOSED) \ SENSITIVE NORMAL 

 

 



RESTRICTED \ SENSITIVE NORMAL 

1 
RESTRICTED \ SENSITIVE NORMAL 

Figure 1A: Front of MID 22002 
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RESTRICTED \ SENSITIVE NORMAL 

 
Figure 1B: Rear of MID 22002 
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RESTRICTED \ SENSITIVE NORMAL 

 
 
 
 

 
 
 

Figure 1C: Side View of MID 22002 
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RESTRICTED \ SENSITIVE NORMAL 

 
 
 

Figure 1D: Side View of MID 22002 
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Figure 1E: Damage Close-up of MID 22002 
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RESTRICTED \ SENSITIVE NORMAL 

 
 
 

Figure 2A - Schematic Diagram Part 1 
 
 

 
 

 
Figure 2B  Schematic Diagram Part 2 
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RESTRICTED \ SENSITIVE NORMAL 

 
 

Figure 2C  Schematic Diagram Part 3 
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Figure 3B   
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Figure 3C  Statement of Witness  
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Figure 4A: Police Report Pt. 1 
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Figure 4B: Police Report Pt. 2  
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Figure 4C: Police Report #2  
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Figure 4D: Police Report #3 Pt. 1  
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Figure 4E: Police #3 Pt. 2 

 


