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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 16 June, 2022 3:59 PM

To: Edmund Teh

Cc: Accident consolidation accident; Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: PJV2DMPL - MA529 (CNTP) - SJT6221R & YQ2760R AT/ALONG KELLOCK ROAD 

T-JUNCTION ZION ROAD ON 15th JUN 2022 AT ABOUT 1220 HOURS

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

Please provide us the following and arrange for survey. 

• evidence i.e. video and scene photo 

• PIR result (if any) 

• GIA / police report 

• Estimated cost of repair 

 
Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Asher. 

 

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 16 June, 2022 9:38 AM 

To: Edmund Teh <edmund@v2d.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Accident consolidation accident 

<accident@v2d.com.sg> 

Subject: Re: PJV2DMPL - MA529 (CNTP) - SJT6221R & YQ2760R AT/ALONG KELLOCK ROAD T-JUNCTION ZION ROAD ON 15th 

JUN 2022 AT ABOUT 1220 HOURS 

 

Dear Edmund, 

 

Thank you for the assignment. 

 

 

Dear Team, 

 

Kindly assist. Thank you. 

 

 
  
Best Regards, 
Yan | Admin  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

 

On 16 Jun 2022, at 8:55 AM, Edmund Teh <edmund@v2d.com.sg> wrote: 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE BASIS 

admin-d@lkkauto.com  assignments@lkkauto.com   Tel: 62563561 

 

Our Ref: MA76529-SJT6221R 

Your Insured Vehicle No.: YQ2760R 

 

Date: 16-JUNE-2022 

 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Blk 51, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933. 

 

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 (claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com  Tel: 6389-6181) 

  

Dear Sir/Madam 

 

NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 2 WORKING DAYS PURSUANT TO PRE-

ACTION PROTOCOL FOR NON INJURY MOTOR ACCIDENT CASES (NIMA) ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING 

MOTOR VEHICLES SJT6221R & YQ2760R AT/ALONG  KELLOCK ROAD T-JUNCTION ZION ROAD ON 15th JUN 

2022 AT ABOUT 1220 HOURS 

 

We have been appointed by IRWAN BIN SAFI'EE to repair the vehicle no. SJT6221R, which is involved in an 

accident stated above. 

- We will contact LKK - Mr Adrian 96893735 for - direct settlement with estimates. 

 

 

Please be informed that the said vehicle can be inspected at: 

PRO-JEX V2D MOTOR PTE LTD 

NO.25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4, #03-93 SYNERGY@KAKI BUKIT, SINGAPORE 417800. 

 

Person-In-Charge: Edmund  

Contact: +65 8668 7666 

 

Take notice that you are required to respond to us within 2 working days of the receiver of this notice as to 

whether you wish to carry out or waive a pre-repair  inspection. 

If we do not hear from you in this regard by the stipulated time, we shall construe your silence as waiver of 

requirement for a pre-repair inspection and we shall proceed to repair our client's vehicle. 

NB: Any settlement of offer is on the express condition that this settlement is in respect of our client's claim 

for property-related damages only and shall not preclude our client from claiming injury-related damages 

arising from this accident. 

 

Thank you & best regards, 
Edmund - 8668-7666 

PRO-JEX V2D MOTOR PTE. LTD. SYNERGY @ KB, No 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4, #03-93 Singapore 417800 

www.v2d.com.sg RECOVERY SERVICE HOTLINE 6100-7676 

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE 
This e-mail (including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential. The sending of this 
e-mail to any person other than the intended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that attaches 
to it. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately, delete the email and do not copy, 
distribute or disclose its contents. 

 


