Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your acceptance.

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Thursday, 11 August 2022 12:27 PM

Alfred Quah

Admin A

RE: AIG TP CLAIM DIRECT SETTLEMENT// SMT4265S
DV_SMT 4265S.pdf

We confirm settlement at a global sum of $5,250.00(all-in).

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Alfred Quah <alfredautoss@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 10 August 2022 6:54 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: AIG TP CLAIM DIRECT SETTLEMENT// SMT4265S

Yes, please proceed. We accept your offer ......

Thank you.

Best Regards



Alfred QUAH (Mr)

Alfred Auto Services & Supplies
ACRA: 391089/00E
HP/Whatsapp: 9145-4773

Tel: 6483-4586

FAX: 6483-4882

Email: alfredautoss@gmail.com

Address:
BLK 5035 #01-351 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 2

SINGAPORE 569538

On Wed, Aug 10, 2022 at 5:11 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@I|kkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $5,250.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 14 July 2022 2:32 PM

To: Alfred Quah <alfredautoss@gmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: AIG TP CLAIM DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We acknowledge receipt of your email dated 13/07/2022.

We will look into the matter and get back to you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Alfred Quah <alfredautoss@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 13 July 2022 5:19 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>; Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)
<jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: AIG TP CLAIM DIRECT SETTLEMENT

DEARSIRS ( URGENT)

We have attached our client SMT4265S LOD for our claim for our Early settlement .Please also note that you or
your insurer should send us an acknowledgement of receipt of this letter within 7 Days of your receipt of this
letter .

Thank you.

Best Regards

Alfred QUAH (Mr)

Alfred Auto Services & Supplies
ACRA: 391089/00E
HP/Whatsapp: 9145-4773

Tel: 6483-4586

FAX: 6483-4882



Email: alfredautoss@gmail.com

Address:

BLK 5035 #01-351 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 2

SINGAPORE 569538



