Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Esther Lim <EstherLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 18 November 2022 5:46 PM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Henry Kao

Subject: RE: O/Ref: D21002039M/TT/OD SBS6403H DOA: 11.07.2021
Dear Bryan

We spoke on the matter.

LTA advised that they are unable to furnish us any supporting document on their NBV of $176,674.39 upon our
request. Please find our Insured’s email attached for your attention.

Kindly readjust the amount based on the figure given by LTA and let us have your advice urgently.
Thank you.

Regards

Esther Lim

Motor Claims

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd
16 Raffles Quay

#42-01 Hong Leong Building
Singapore 048581

D: 6507 3803 | M: 6507 3848 | F: 6507 3849
Website http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg
atremver of [[ETCINE] INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA™):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.

If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the
sender immediately by return e-mail.

From: Nathaniel Saw < >

Sent: Friday, 18 November 2022 4:05 pm

To: Bazlin Ahmad < >; Mary Nelson < >

Cc: Wu Tzu Ying < >; Selamat Bin Basir < >; Amirah Aziz
< >; Venkatesan PV < >; Subramanian Kasi

< >; Esther Lim < >; Henry Kao

< >; Novin Siah < >

Subject: Re: O/Ref: D21002039M/TT/OD SBS6403H DOA: 11.07.2021

Hi Bazlin, LTA (Authority) did not provide any supporting documents. The amount is as stated in the email from LTA.



Thanks.

Rgds,
Saw

Get Outlook for iOS

From: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg>

Sent: Friday, November 18, 2022 4:03:14 PM

To: Mary Nelson <marynelson@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Nathaniel Saw <nathaniel.saw@towertransit.sg>
Cc: Wu Tzu Ying <Wu.Zy@towertransit.sg>; Selamat Bin Basir <Selamat.Basir@towertransit.sg>; Amirah Aziz
<Amirah.Aziz@towertransit.sg>; Venkatesan PV <Venkatesan@towertransit.sg>; Subramanian Kasi
<Subramanian.kasi@towertransit.sg>; Esther Lim <EstherLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Henry Kao
<HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Novin Siah <NovinSiah@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: O/Ref: D21002039M/TT/OD SBS6403H DOA: 11.07.2021

Hi Saw
Please assist with our insurer’s request below and forward them the docs asap.

~ Please advise whether LTA had furnished any supporting document on their NBV of $176,674.39? If
so, kindly extend a copy to us and we shall discuss further with LKK to re-assess the claim.

Thank You

Best Regards

Senior Executive, Claims
Mobile +65 9199 0025

Email bazlin.ahmad@towertransit.sg

Tower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd
21 Bulim Drive, Bulim Bus Depot, Singapore 648170
TRANSIT : i

Registration number 201419417K

_—"——-.____
' www.towertransit.sg

Disclaimer: This email and any attached files may be coincidental, privileged and intended solely for the addressee .lt may not
filed or communicated to or by any other person. If you have received this email by error, please delete it and notify the send
expressed in this email are not necessarily the views of Tower Transit.

From: Bazlin Ahmad

Sent: Thursday, November 17, 2022 11:35 AM

To: Esther Lim <EstherLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Wu Tzu Ying <Wu.Zy@towertransit.sg>; Selamat Bin Basir <Selamat.Basir@towertransit.sg>; Amirah Aziz
<Amirah.Aziz@towertransit.sg>; Henry Kao <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Venkatesan PV
<Venkatesan@towertransit.sg>; Nathaniel Saw <nathaniel.saw@towertransit.sg>; Subramanian Kasi




<Subramanian.kasi@towertransit.sg>
Subject: RE: O/Ref: D21002039M/TT/OD SBS6403H DOA: 11.07.2021

Hi Esther

We refer to the above reference, LTA informed us that the NBV for SBS6403H is $176,674.39. (Please
refer attached email).

Possible to adjust the settflement amount 2

Thank You

Best Regards

Senior Executive, Claims
Mobile +65 9199 0025
Email bazlin.ahmad@towertransit.sg

Tower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd
21 Bulim Drive, Bulim Bus Depot, Singapore 648170
TRANSIT : i

Registration number 201419417K

_“_"——-—____
' www.towertransit.sg

Disclaimer: This email and any attached files may be coincidental, privileged and intended solely for the addressee .lt may not
filed or communicated to or by any other person. If you have received this email by error, please delete it and notify the send
expressed in this email are not necessarily the views of Tower Transit.




