Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Thanaletchumi Santerashigaram <thana@jackcars.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 21 December 2022 4:29 PM

To: Finalization

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FINALISATION : SKJ929M

Greetings Ms. Veron ,

For an amicable settlement would agree with the COR @ $6,075.50 with DOR @ 5 days
Kindly acknowledge.

Thank You.

Best Regards ,

S.Thanaletchumi (Ms)

Claims Manager

JACK CARS ENTERPRISE PTE LTD
Office : 67488824

Mobile : 91701900

Fax :67488834

Email : thana@jackcars.com.sq
Save the ELarth- Print only when necessary-

On Fri, Dec 16, 2022 at 12:57 PM Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Thana,

Kindly refer our finalize $6075.50 (P/P, before GST). 5 days.

Your finalisation email can add in subject to insurance approval.

Thanks

Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 1 November 2022 9:58 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: #% /< : URGENT : FINALISATION : SKJ929M - SURVEY ARRANGEMENT

KA A Thanaletchumi Santerashigaram <thana@jackcars.com.sg>

CRi%: 20224£11 H1H 9:57:48 (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

etk A : Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
FE#: URGENT : FINALISATION : SKJ929M - SURVEY ARRANGEMENT

Greetings Mr.Guo Qiang ,

Kindly finalise the COR.

Thank You.

Best Regards ,

S.Thanaletchumi (Ms)

Claims Manager

JACK CARS ENTERPRISE PTE LTD
Office : 67488824

Mobile : 91701900

Fax :67488834

Email : thana@jackcars.com.sq

Save the ELarth: Frint only wher necessary-

On Tue, Sep 27, 2022 at 12:38 PM Thanaletchumi Santerashigaram <thana@jackcars. com. sg>
wrote:

Greetings Mr.Guo Qiang ,
Kindly finalise the COR.
Thank You.

Best Regards ,

S.Thanaletchumi (Ms)

Claims Manager

JACK CARS ENTERPRISE PTE LTD
Office : 67488824

Mobile : 91701900

Fax :67488834

Email : thana@jackcars.com.sq

Save the ELarth: Frint only wher necessary-

—————————— Forwarded message ————————

From: Thanaletchumi Santerashigaram <{thana@jackcars. com. sg>
Date: Fri, Jul 29, 2022 at 12:20 PM

Subject: FINALISATION : SKJ929M - SURVEY ARRANGEMENT




To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <guogiang@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto. com>

Greetings Mr.Guo Qiang ,

Kindly finalise the COR.
Thank You.

Best Regards ,

S.Thanaletchumi (Ms)

Claims Manager

JACK CARS ENTERPRISE PTE LTD
Office : 67488824

Mobile : 91701900

Fax :67488834

Email : thana@jackcars.com.sq
Save the ELarth- Print only when necessary-

On Fri, Jul 1, 2022 at 5:04 PM Yan (LKK Auto) <admin—-d@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Thana,

Noted with thanks.

Note: With immediate effect 04/03/2022 Summer Lee(assignment Team) will no longer be in our company.

Please contact the undersign for survey arrangement.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Thanaletchumi Santerashigaram <thana@jackcars. com. sg>
Sent: Friday, 1 July 2022 4:53 PM

To: Yan (LKK Auto) <admin—-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: sur@lkkauto. com; assignments <assignments@lkkauto. com>
Subject: Re: SKJ929M — SURVEY ARRANGEMENT

Greetings Ms.Yan ,

Kindly arrange for a survey on 05/07/2022 after 1400hrs.
Kindly acknowledge.

Thank You.

Best Regards ,
S.Thanaletchumi (Ms)



Claims Manager

JACK CARS ENTERPRISE PTE LTD
Office : 67488824

Mobile : 91701900

Fax :67488834

Email : thana@jackcars.com.sq
Save the ELarth- Print only when necessary-

On Tue, Jun 28, 2022 at 12:22 PM Yan (LKK Auto) <admin—-d@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Thana,

Noted with thanks.

Note: With immediate effect 04/03/2022 Summer Lee(assignment Team) will no longer be in our company.

Please contact the undersign for survey arrangement.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Thanaletchumi Santerashigaram <thana@jackcars. com. sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 28 June 2022 12:13 PM

To: Yan (LKK Auto) <admin—-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: sur@lkkauto. com; assignments <assignments@lkkauto. com>
Subject: Re: SKJ929M — SURVEY ARRANGEMENT

Greetings Ms.Yan ,

Kindly cancel the survey on 29/06/2022.
Will reschedule the survey.

Kindly acknowledge.

Thank You.

Best Regards ,

S.Thanaletchumi (Ms)

Claims Manager

JACK CARS ENTERPRISE PTE LTD
Office : 67488824

Mobile : 91701900

Fax :67488834

Email : thana@jackcars.com.sq
Save the ELarth- Print only when necessary-

On Wed, Jun 22, 2022 at 4:28 PM Yan (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> wrote:
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Dear Thana,

Noted with thanks.

Note: With immediate effect 04/03/2022 Summer Lee(assignment Team) will no longer be in our company.

Please contact the undersign for survey arrangement.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Thanaletchumi Santerashigaram <thana@jackcars. com. sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 22 June 2022 4:23 PM

To: YAN <admin—d@lkkauto. com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto. com>

Subject: SKJ929M — SURVEY ARRANGEMENT

Greetings Ms.Yan ,

Kindly arrange for a survey on 29/06/2022 after 1400hrs.
Kindly acknowledge.

Thank You.

Best Regards ,

S.Thanaletchumi (Ms)

Claims Manager

JACK CARS ENTERPRISE PTE LTD
Office : 67488824

Mobile : 91701900

Fax :67488834

Email : thana@jackcars.com.sq
Save the ELarth- Print only when necessary-

On Wed, Jun 15, 2022 at 4:30 PM YAN <admin—-d@lkkauto. com> wrote:

Dear Thana,

As spoken, vehicle currently not in the workshop, please let us know in advance if
any arrangement.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




