From

Subject:

Date:
To:
Cc:

: GERALD POH WEE BIN geraldpoh@|onpac.com

FW: NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN 2 WORKING DAYS PURSUANT TO
PARAGRAPH 6.2 OF PRE-ACTION PROTOCOL FOR NIMA CASES

15 June 2022 at 3:55 PM

assignments assignments @lkkauto.com

MT_Claim_SG mt_claim@lonpac.com

Lonpac External - General

Dear Yan,
FYNA
Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone
bribery, fraud or corrupt practices.

From: Samantha Woo <samantha@hoh.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 15 June 2022 3:54 pm

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION
WITHIN 2 WORKING DAYS PURSUANT TO PARAGRAPH 6.2 OF PRE-ACTION
PROTOCOL FOR NIMA CASES

Dear Gerald,

We refer to your email as appended below.

Please note that our client has chosen 5. Adrian Ling — KK to conduct the survey.
Thank you.

Regards

Samantha Woo

Paralegal

DID: (65) 6244 5759 | Fax: (65) 6244 3052
Blk 209 New Upper Changi Road #04-631 Singapore 460209

HOH

LAW CORPORATION ﬂ‘



Incorporated in Singapore with limited liability
(Registration No. 2003028982)

This message is privileged and confidential and is intended solely for the named
recipient. Any review, dissemination or other use of, or commencement of any action in
reliance upon this information by persons other than the intended recipient is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination or
copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If this e-mail has reached you in
error, please delete the e-mail immediately and inform us of the error by sending an e-
mail to samantha(@hoh.com.sg.

Important Note to Clients: As there has been a rise in email scams in financial
transactions, please call us to check with us before proceeding with any electronic
transfer of funds/payments should you receive any request from our lawyers or staff to
transfer such funds by way of electronic means (e.g. telegraphic transfer or internet bank
transfer). Thank you.

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 15 June 2022 9:31 am

To: Samantha Woo <samantha@hoh.com.sg>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ionpac.com>

Subject: RE: NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION
WITHIN 2 WORKING DAYS PURSUANT TO PARAGRAPH 6.2 OF PRE-ACTION
PROTOCOL FOR NIMA CASES

Lonpac External - General

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Our Ref: 21/22/22/VC05/025873

Dear Samantha,

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle and
enclose our list of Motor surveyors for your attention:-

Nicholas Tey—-Appraisal
Jackson Quek - Appraisal
Lim Teow Guan - LKK

Ang Bryan Tani- LKK

Adrian Ling - LKK

Kenneth Kong - LKK

Thevan T Karthikesavan- LKK
Mohd Rasul - LKK

Marcus Chua -LKK

Xing Guo Qiang -LKK
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Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone
bribery, fraud or corrupt practices.

From: Samantha Woo <samantha@hoh.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 15 June 2022 9:08 am

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Cc: Michael Han <michael@hoh.com.sg>; Justin Thia <justin@hoh.com.sg>;
kaixian96 @gmail.com

Subject: NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION WITHIN
2 WORKING DAYS PURSUANT TO PARAGRAPH 6.2 OF PRE-ACTION
PROTOCOL FOR NIMA CASES

Dear Sirs (VERY URGENT),

ACCIDENT ON 31/05/2022 @_15:00PM ALONG PIE CHANGI AT STEVENS
ROAD EXIT INVOLVING FBS7501B & GBF3072S

We refer to the above matter.

We act for the owner of vehicle, Ms Zoelle Chea Kai Xian who has appointed the
undermentioned workshop to repair her motor vehicle no. FBS7501B.

Please be informed that the said vehicle can be inspected at:

M/s Kim Heng Seng Motor

Blk 9002 Tampines Street 93
#01-16 Tampines Industrial Park
Singapore 528836

Contact number: 6784 7017

If you fail to conduct the pre-repair inspection within the next (2) working days
excluding any intervening Saturday, Sunday or Public Holiday, the said workshop will
commence repairs thereafter without further reference to you.

Regards

Samantha Woo

Paralegal

DID: (65) 6244 5759 | Fax: (65) 6244 3052

Blk 209 New Upper Changi Road #04-631 Singapore 460209
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Incorporated in Singapore with limited liability
(Registration No. 200302898Z)

This message is privileged and confidential and is intended solely for the named
recipient. Any review, dissemination or other use of, or commencement of any action in
reliance upon this information by persons other than the intended recipient is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination or
copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If this e-mail has reached you in
error, please delete the e-mail immediately and inform us of the error by sending an e-
mail to samantha(@hoh.com.sg.

Important Note to Clients: As there has been a rise in email scams in financial
transactions, please call us to check with us before proceeding with any electronic
transfer of funds/payments should you receive any request from our lawyers or staff to
transfer such funds by way of electronic means (e.g. telegraphic transfer or internet bank
transfer). Thank you.



