From: Tan Kah Leong Kahleong.Tan@sg.cntaiping.com
Subject: RE: SNM22D203949/C02/GBK8610E/TANKL / FW: TP CLAIM : SMN1225J AGAINST YOUR INSURED : GBK8610E
DOA : 04.06.2022
Date: 15 June 2022 at 2:45 PM
To: Kevin Leong Wai Kit kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg, assignments assignments@|kkauto.com
Cc: sur@lkkauto.com, Andre Chow En De andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg, Edwin Abcede Caina
edwin.caina@cyclecarriage.com.sg, Coco Lu Ting coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Kevin,
We refer to your email below.

We will be assigning M/s LKK Auto Consultants to survey your client’s vehicle on a
without prejudice basis.

Aside to LKK,
Please refer to the email below & proceed to survey the third party vehicle.

Thank you.

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy
documents to us as delay is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents. All
correspondence should be made via email claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax

at 6224 7175. . Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Regards

Tan Kah Leong
Senior Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6193 | F: (65) 6224 7175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain
confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial,
is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and
any copies of it thereafter.

From: Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, June 15, 2022 1:18 PM

To: Tan Kah Leong <KahLeong.Tan@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Edwin Abcede Caina
<edwin.caina@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting
<coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SNM22D203949/C02/GBK8610E/TANKL / FW: TP CLAIM : SMN1225J
AGAINST YOUR INSURED : GBK8610E DOA : 04.06.2022

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open
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Dear Kah Leong,

We choose : Steve Chen -LKK

Thank You & Best regards

Kevin Leong

Claim Division Operations
209 Pandan Gardens
Singapore 609339

@C@: Exceptional Journeys

CYCLE & CARRIAGE

Cycle & Carriage Singapore « 209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339
T: +65 6568 4501 « F: +65 6565 1240 * H: +65 81680997 « www.cyclecarriage.com.sg

it .
q A member of the Jardine Cycle & Carriage Group

From: Tan Kah Leong <Kahl eong.Tan(@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 15 June 2022 1:15 pm

To: Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Andre Chow En De
<andre.chow(@gcyclecarriage.com.sg>; Edwin Abcede Caina <edwin.caina(@gcyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu
Ting <coco.lu@gyclecarriage.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SNM22D203949/C02/GBK8610E/TANKL / FW: TP CLAIM : SMN1225J AGAINST YOUR
INSURED : GBK8610E DOA : 04.06.2022

This email was sent from outside of your organisation

Without Prejudice

Dear Kevin,

We refer to your email below.

Please see attached and let us know if you agree with SJE.

Thank you.

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay
is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via
email claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. . Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Regards



Tan Kah Leong
Senior Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6193 | F: (65) 6224 7175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain
confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial,
is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and
any copies of it thereafter.

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, June 15, 2022 11:22 AM

To: Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong(@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Andre Chow En De
<andre.chow(@gcyclecarriage.com.sg>; edwin.caina@gcyclecarriage.com.sg; Coco Lu Ting
<coco.lu@gcyclecarriage.com.sg>; Tan Kah Leong <Kahl.eong. Tan(@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: O/R: SNM22D203949/C02/GBK8610E/TANKL / FW: TP CLAIM : SMN1225J AGAINST YOUR
INSURED : GBK8610E DOA : 04.06.2022

Without Prejudice
Dear Kah Leong,

Please conduct PRS for SMIN1225]J.

Note: officer in charge Tan Kah Leong 63896193.

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay
is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Thank you

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896116 | F: (65) 62247175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: AF-fits Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may
contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately.
Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter

From: Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>



Sent: Tuesday, 14 June 2022 6:53 PM
To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow(@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Edwin Abcede Caina
<edwin.caina@gcyclecarriage.com.sg™>; Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Subject: TP CLAIM : SMN1225J] AGAINST YOUR INSURED : GBK8610E DOA : 04.06.2022

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear All,

Our Client : SMIN1225J vs your insured : GBK8610E

Above attach SAS report and repair quotation for your reference.

Please let us have the liability.

Thank You & Best regards

Kevin Leong

Claim Division Operations
209 Pandan Gardens
Singapore 609339
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Exceptional Journeys

Cycle & Carriage Singapore - 209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339
T: +65 6568 4501 - F: +65 6565 1240 - H: +65 81680997 - www.cyclecarriage.com.sg

é}; A member of the Jardine Cycle & Carriage Group

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and
destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the
views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only
for the use of the individual or entity named above and may contain information that is
privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are notified that any dissemination,
distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you have
received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the
original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not
necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related
corporations.

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only
for the use of the individual or entity named above and may contain information that is
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dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly

prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by
return email and destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the
individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd

and/or any of its related corporations.
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CYCLE & CARRIAGE

CYCLE & CARRIAGE KIA PTE LTD

PANDAN GARDENS CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE
209 Pandan Gardens Singapore 609339 Tel 65684555 Fax: 65651240

L

Mo Tyt

Co Reg No : 199405410K ESTIMATE GST Reg No : MR-8500111.X
Invoice Name & Addross Owner Name & Vehicle Info
PUA CHIA HOW (PAN JIANHAO) Cust No/Name PUA CHIA HOM (PAN JIANAD)
Reg No/Reg Date SMNI225) / 06/08/201
BLK 312C CLEMENTI AVENUE 4 Date In/Mileage 0
#36-193 Chassis Mo KNAPHB 1 B5K5524332
SINGAPORE 123312
Engine No DAMBUN205163
Contact No Mobile: 91054231 Make/Mode! KIA/SORENTO 2.2 A D GT SR 4WD GDJ!
Colour/Trim KLG STEEL GREY / WK SATURN BLACK
Account No  Terms Date/Time Printod CSE Operator WIP No
CSM00081 Cash 07/06/2022/ 18:49 282 / Kevin Leong 52330
Description of Goods / Services Qty  Unit Price Disc% Amount
L PNTB88000 1280.00
REPLACE ON REAR BUNPER, REAR BUMPER LWR & AFFECTED AREA
E PNT98000 1650.00
PAINT WORK ON REAR BUMPER & REAR KM FENDER
£ PNT8B000 150
RIMYOE & INSTALL REAR PARKING ASSIST FOR FACILITATE REPAIR
N SUNDRY B
PERFORM RUST PREVENTION
N SUNDRY 50.00
O APPLY SEALANT ON AFFECTED AREA
A 54900099 150.00
CHECK WIRING & CHASSIS ELECTRICAL SYSTEM
A 10028901 280.0¢
10 CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK ON ELECTRONIC CONTROL SYSTEM
M SUNDRY 50.00
SUNDRIES
M GARNISH ASSY-FNOR SIDE,RH 1.00 109.00 00.00 109.00
M COVER-RR BUMPER,UPR 1.00 632.00 00.00 632.00
M COVER-RR BUMPER LWR 1.00 $94.00 00.00 594.00C
M SKID PLATE-RR BUMPER 1.00 103.00 00.00 103.00
M BRACKET ASSY-RR BUMPER SIDE,RM 1.00 30.00 00.00 30.00
M COVER-BLANKING RR FOG,RH 1.00 44.00 00.00 44.00
M LANP ASSY-REAR FOG & R/REFL ,RH 1.00 134.00 00.00 134.0C
M RAIL ASSY-REAR BUMPER 1.00 341.00 00.00 341.00
Confirm & accopted by
Nett 5.,647.00
7% 65T om 5647.00 395.29
Total Payable 6,042.29
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Valldity of this estimate §s 14 days from date of geete. This is a computer peserated document, %0 signature s required.

Estinated costs quoted are excluding CST. We would mention that the abeove cstimate is based om owr iaitial faspection and does not include
any acditional parts or labour which may be required after repair work has comsesced. Occasiosally worm or damaged parts are discovered
after work has started and seeded for repairs or repl W . Should this eccur, wo would advise you. Please be informed that a
deposit of 50% of the above estimite is payable before commencoment of work. Paymeat for this say e sade in cash, credit card or
cheque. You must alse agree to pay full amount for resewal of the windscreen in the evest of imadvertest breskage in the course of resewing
the rebiber seal or other repair requiring the removal of the wingscrees,
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