Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 28 June 2022 4:16 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: FBT2007P Finalize

Attachments: FBT 2007 main estimate.pdf; FBT 2007 supp1.pdf

Hi Shiau Chan,

Workshop agreed finalize.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 28 June 2022 2:31 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: FBT2007P Finalize

Hi Steve ,
We confirm acceptance of your offer $2400.00 @4days .

Thanks,
Southern Motor
6273-0369

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, June 27, 2022 7:54 PM

To: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com>
Subject: FBT2007P Finalize

Hi Ti TI,

Kindly refer our finalize $2400 (L/S, before GST). 4 days.



Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 24 June 2022 4:26 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FBT2007P

Hi Steve,

Kindly check motorcycle FBT2007P photo after repair.
May | Know your final amount ?

Thank You
Ti Ti

Southern Motor
6273-0369



