Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 30 August 2022 10:27 AM

To: Mohamad Bin Mohd Sanif

Cc: Lee Tong Ren Keniji; Toh Jing Xuan; Keith Leo Chi Yung; Bernard Wan Chong Huat;
Cresendo Llurca Lagman; Teng Wai Khan; Inthiran Thurasamy; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FINAL REPORT----- SGB566R--DS. REF:2022 22005053/FR

Attachments: SGB 566 final & supp.pdf; SGB 566 main estimate1.pdf

Hi Mohd Sanif,

Finalize amount correct. Please proceed.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mohamad Bin Mohd Sanif <mohd.sanif@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 29 August 2022 7:06 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>; Mohamad Bin Mohd Sanif <mohd.sanif@simedarby.com.sg>
Cc: Lee Tong Ren Keniji <lee.tong.ren.kenji@simedarby.com.sg>; Toh Jing Xuan <toh.jing.xuan@simedarby.com.sg>;
Keith Leo Chi Yung <keith.leo.chiyung@simedarby.com.sg>; Bernard Wan Chong Huat
<bernard.wan@simedarby.com.sg>; Cresendo Llurca Lagman <cresendo.lagman@simedarby.com.sg>; Teng Wai
Khan <teng.wai.khan@simedarby.com.sg>; Inthiran Thurasamy <inthiran.thurasamy@simedarby.com.sg>

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FINAL REPORT-----SGB566R--DS. REF:2022 22005053/FR

Without Prejudice

We refer to above matter and attachment Final Report.
Kindly confirm quantum for COR:

Total Labour : $2044.00

Total Parts : $492.15

Total Labour and Parts : $2536.15

Repair workdays : 3 days.



CAR RENTAL=$300.00

GIA SEARCH FEE=$2.00

Thank you.

Best regard,
Mohd.Sanif
Bodyshop

BMW

Performance Motors

DDI: +65 6319 0148

FAX: +65 6474 3229

Address : 303 Alexandra Road, Singapore 159941
Email: mohd.sanif@simedarby.com.sg

www.bmw.com.sg

Sime Darby Motors
A member of the Sime Darby Group



