Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 6 June, 2022 4:45 PM

To: oscar@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg; Admin A; assignments

Cc: raymond@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg;
shujuan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg; kenho@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg

Subject: RE: SLR591Z TP Claim against SMB246G

Categories: HMK

Dear Oscar,

Thank you for the assignment.

We will arrange survey accordingly.

Note: With immediate effect 04/03/2022 Summer Lee(assignment Team) will no longer be in our company.

Please contact the undersign for survey arrangement.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: oscar@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg <oscar@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 6 June 2022 4:14 PM

To: 'Admin-D (LKKAuto)' <admin-d @lkkauto.com>; 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'assignments'
<assignments @lkkauto.com>

Cc: raymond @ automotiverepaircentre.com.sg; shujuan @ automotiverepaircentre.com.sg;

kenho @automotiverepaircentre.com.sg

Subject: SLR591Z TP Claim against SMB246G

Dear Person in-charge,

Our client's vehicle SLR591Z wants to make a third party claim against SMB246G is insured by China Taiping
Insurance and would like to direct settlement with LKK.

Please find attached the accident report and estimate.

Kindly acknowledge with the Claim officer in-charge for liability / settlement of our client’s claim.

Note to LKK Survey Team,

Vehicle SLR591Z is currently our workshop. Kindly arrange survey on at Woodlands Industrial Park E1.



Thank you.

Oscar Pong

Automotive Repair Centre Pte Ltd
38 Woodlands Industrial Park E1
#05-18

Singapore 757700

Tel: +65 6468 8834

Fax: +65 6462 2278

HP: +65 92279933



