Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 6 September 2022 3:35 PM

To: ‘Kai Motor

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Vehicle No. Lexus SGX327Z And SKX799Y On 05/06/2022 @
13:15pm. *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG22005654/Apa3

Attachments: PIR from Ol_.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/mdm,

We attached here with a copy of Police Investigation Result submitted by our insured for your easy reference. It
shows that action was being taken against your client for Careless Driving.

Please check with your client if he had received any letter from traffic police.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 18 July 2022 1:54 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Accident Involving Vehicle No. Lexus SGX327Z And SKX799Y On 05/06/2022 @ 13:15pm. *** LKK REF:
CC6/AIG22005654/Apa3

Date : 18/07/2022

Attn: The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Your Insured veh no : SGX 799 Y



AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD. (By Email Only)
78 Shenton Way

# 07-16 Chartis Building

Singapore 079120

Dear Sir / Madam

Final Cost of repair for Vehicle No. Lexus SGX327Z And SKX799Y On 05/06/2022 @ 13:15pm.

To Supply :-

Total P by P As Of Repair Costs Recommended By Surveyor And

Agreed By Ourselves : S 750.00
GST 7% S 52.50
S 802.50

Date : 18/07/2022

Attn: The Motor Claims Department

Your Insured veh no : SGX 799 Y

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD. (By Email Only)
78 Shenton Way



# 07-16 Chartis Building
Singapore 079120

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam
Accident Involving Vehicle No. Lexus SGX327Z And SKX799Y On 05/06/2022 @ 13:15pm.
We have been authorised by LEE YEOW GUAN , the owner of vehicle
claim against the party/ parties responsible for the damages arising from number SGX327Z,

to the above mentioned accident.

Our records show that you are the insurers of vehicle number (SKX799Y) at the material time
of the accident with the driver of our client’s vehicle, (LEE YEOW GUAN ).

As a result of the accident caused by your insured driver’s negligent driving and/or management
of your insured’s vehicle number (SKX799Y) , our client’s vehicle was damaged and we have
been put to loss and damage as follows:

(1) Cost of repair S 802.50
(2)Loss of use 3days X 80 S 240.00
(3) PIR 2days S 160.00
(4) LTA Fee S 7.45

S 1,209.95

A cope of each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:
(a) Final repair bill

(b) GIA report with sketch plan of (our client’s veh number)
(c) LTA Search

On Tue, 21 Jun 2022 at 10:26, Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Attached is Accident Footage for your perusal.
Best regards,

Wendy

On Mon, 20 Jun 2022 at 11:45, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice



Dear Sirs/mdm,

Please be informed that our insured has yet lodge the accident report.

Please provide us the following for our necessary action: -

e evidence i.e. video and scene photo
e  PIR result (if any)

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 15 June 2022 2:42 PM

To: Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Vehicle No. Lexus SGX327Z And SKX799Y On 05/06/2022 @ 13:15pm. *** LKK REF:
CC6/AIG22005654/Apa3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
Please be informed that OI has yet to report the accident.

Please provide us the following.



e evidence i.e. video and scene photo
e PIRresult (if any)

Our respective case handler, Hsiao Tong will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 10 June, 2022 11:02 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Accident Involving Vehicle No. Lexus SGX327Z And SKX799Y On 05/06/2022 @ 13:15pm.

KAI MOTOR TRADING
BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1
#01-440, SINGAPORE 408701
TEL: 67474006 FAX:67437591
E-mail : kaimotor@gmail.com
REG NO: 44223100L

Date : 10/06/2022



Attn: The Motor Claims Department
Your Insured veh no : SGX 799 Y

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD.
78 Shenton Way

# 07-16 Chartis Building

Singapore 079120

KAl MOTOR TRADING
BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1
#01-440, SINGAPORE 408701
TEL: 67474006 FAX:67437591
E-mail : kaimotor@gmail.com
REG NO: 44223100L

Date : 10/06/2022

Attn: The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Your Insured veh no : SGX 799 Y

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD. (By Email Only)

78 Shenton Way

# 07-16 Chartis Building
Singapore 079120

Dear Sir / Madam
Accident Involving Vehicle No. Lexus SGX327Z And SKX799Y On 05/06/2022 @ 13:15pm.

We are writing on behalf of LEE YEOW GUAN the registered owner
of SGX327Z which was involved on the above mentioned accident between SKW799Y.

Investigation reveals that the motor vehicle number SKW799Y was insured with you at the
material time of the said accident.

As a result of the accident was caused solely and completely by the negligence of your
insured vehicle number SKW799Y. Therefore, our client is holding you liable for the repair
costs and other consequential loss which was sustained by him/her/them.

Kindly arrange your representative to survey our client’s v ehicle at KAl MOTOR TRADING
Blk 3007, Ubi Road 1, #01-440, Singapore 408701 within two (2) days from the date hereof as
to avoid further losses incur.

We enclosed hereby the GIA report of SGX327Z for your kind attention.

Failing which, our client have no alternative but to proceed with the necessary repairs and
the bill will be forward to you for reimbursement.

Yours faithfully,



Have a nice day with thanks.

BB RIFHI— K.

Ms Kim
Kai Motor Trading

Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440
Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006

Have a nice day with thanks.

REFERHFH—XK.

Ms Kim
Kai Motor Trading

Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440
Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006

Have a nice day with thanks.

REFERHFH—X.

Ms Kim
Kai Motor Trading

Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440
Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006



