Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: alicechau <alicechau@kanfs.net>

Sent: Monday, 27 June 2022 9:38 AM

To: SUR

Subject: Fw: SKS778J (OD) Claim ref: 2022 22005182

Dear Sirs,

FYI.

Thank you.

Regards,

Alice

Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop

Tel:6747 9560
Fax:6748 1006

---------- Forwarded Message -----------

From:"Koh, Janice (Allianz Insurance Singapore)" <janice.koh@allianz.sg>
To:"alicechau@kanfs.net" <alicechau@kanfs.net>

Cc:"Lim, Sharon (Allianz Insurance Singapore)" <sharon.lim@allianz.sg>
Sent:Wed, 22 Jun 2022 05:14:38 +0000

Subject:SKS778J (OD) Claim ref: 2022 22005182

Dear Alice,

As spoken earlier on.

Our management had come to a decision to pay for the extra labor cost incurred for spray painting headlamp.

As such please proceed to send insured vehicle to his prefer workshop to get his headlamp spray painting done and
paid for the cost first. Follow by add in the cost into OD invoice.

Please be reminded to include extra sentence that KFS will not be liable for any leakage clauses since spray painting
of the headlamp was not done by your workshop and get insured to sign on the sentence to ack it.

Let me know if you need further clarification.

Thank you



Janice Koh
Claims Specialist

Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C

79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

QQP | Anianz @ | (.o

Warldwide Olympi ond Poralymplc Portner

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify
the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

&4 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Lim, Sharon (Allianz Insurance Singapore)

Sent: 16 June, 2022 09:51 AM

To: 'alicechau@kanfs.net' <alicechau@kanfs.net>
Subject: RE: [EXT] SKS778J (OD) Claim ref: 2022 22005182

Internal

Dear Alice

We will liaise directly with Insured for this towing fee.

Thank you.

Sharon Lim

Claims & Performance Management Department

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C



79 Robinson Road #09-01 Singapore 068897

OQO | Allianz @ | (.

Warldwide Olympi ond Poralymplc Portner

From: alicechau <alicechau@kanfs.net>

Sent: Wednesday, June 15, 2022 4:33 PM

To: Lim, Sharon (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <sharon.lim@allianz.sg>
Subject: [EXT] SKS778J (OD) Claim ref: 2022 22005182

Dear Sharon,

We refer to the mentioned claim.

Please note that the vehicle owner want to claim for the towing fee.
Attached the receipt for your kind attention.

Thank you.

Regards,

Alice

Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop

Tel:6747 9560
Fax:6748 1006



