Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: HC Auto <hcauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 15 September 2022 5:24 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); sur@lkkauto.com.sg; hcauto@singnet.com.sg
Subject: RE: GBC 6220 H DOA: 10 - 06 - 2022 (Finalise)

Dear Kenneth,
We confirm COR at L/S $3,300.00 (before GST) and 06 working days.

Best Regards,

Weon Hui

H C Auto Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive, #05-09 Sin Ming Auto City, Singapore 575722
(DID): 6873 8812 | Office: 6457 0678 | Fax: 6457 8287

From: HC Auto <hcauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, September 6, 2022 2:21 PM

To: KennethKong@lkkauto.com

Cc: 'Veron Chen (LKKAuto)' <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: GBC 6220 H DOA: 10 - 06 - 2022 (Finalise)

Dear Kenneth,
Please finalise the case as below :

MSIG

1) Our Ref : GBB 6220 H Your Ref : SMA 8214 M DOA : 10-06-2022 (07 working days)
Thank You.

Best Regards,

Weon Hui

H C Auto Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive, #05-09 Sin Ming Auto City, Singapore 575722
(DID): 6873 8812 | Office: 6457 0678 | Fax: 6457 8287



