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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 25 August 2022 9:16 AM
To: HKL Lim Team Motorsport
Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: RE: FBL977U Finalize
Attachments: GIRO AUTHORISATION FORM.PDF; DV_FBL977U.pdf

 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for your acceptance. 
 
Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
 
LONPAC is targeting to process all payments via e-payments. Hence, please complete and return the attached GIRO 
Form to enable LONPAC to process their payment. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: HKL Lim Team Motorsport <hkllimteam@gmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 24 August 2022 5:58 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: FBL977U Finalize 
 
Yes, please proceed.  
 
On Wed, Aug 24, 2022 at 5:50 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
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Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sirs/mdm, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We propose settlement as follows: - 

  

1. Cost of Repair  $ 1,132.00 
2. Loss of Use (1day x $40.00) $      40.00  

Total $ 1,172.00 

  

Please confirm acceptance. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: HKL Lim Team Motorsport <hkllimteam@gmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 18 August 2022 10:11 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: FBL977U Finalize 

  

Hi Hsiao Tong  
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Resend  

  

Any update for this claims 

  

On Wed, Aug 17, 2022 at 9:11 PM HKL Lim Team Motorsport <hkllimteam@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Hsiao Tong  

  

Any update for this claims 

  

On Wed, Aug 10, 2022 at 8:32 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

  

We are preparing report to seek mandate from our principal. 

  

We will expedite the matter and get back to you. 

  

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: HKL Lim Team Motorsport <hkllimteam@gmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, 8 August 2022 10:00 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: FBL977U Finalize 

  

Hi 

  

Any payment update for this claim 

  

On Tue, Aug 2, 2022 at 1:07 PM HKL Lim Team Motorsport <hkllimteam@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Ms Chew, 

  

Please find the attached LOD and process the payment. 

  

  

On Tue, Aug 2, 2022 at 11:09 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

  

Thank you for your email. 



5

   

Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental 
receipt) to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be 
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: HKL Lim Team Motorsport <hkllimteam@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 2 August 2022 10:55 AM 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: FBL977U Finalize 

  

Please proceed.  

  

On Tue, Aug 2, 2022 at 10:49 AM Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi James, 
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COR $1132 , 1 day. 

  

Subject to insurance approval. 

  

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 

  

  

From: HKL Lim Team Motorsport [mailto:hkllimteam@gmail.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 27 July 2022 9:27 PM 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) 
Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Re: FBL977U Finalize 

  

Hi Taufikh 

  

Resend 

  

Please finalize for this bike  

  

On Wed, Jul 20, 2022 at 9:06 PM HKL Lim Team Motorsport <hkllimteam@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Taufikh 

  

Please finalize for this bike  
 

  

--  
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Thank You. 

  

  

  

Best Regards 

  

James Lim  

(General Manager) 

Tel:+65 9242 3895 

  

 

UEN: 202218929Z 

BLK 1008 #01-24 Bukit Merah Lane 3, Singapore 159722 

Tel:+65 6275-6656, 6275-6566  

 
 

  

--  
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Thank You. 

  

  

  

Best Regards 

  

James Lim  

(General Manager) 

Tel:+65 9242 3895 

  

 

UEN: 202218929Z 

BLK 1008 #01-24 Bukit Merah Lane 3, Singapore 159722 

Tel:+65 6275-6656, 6275-6566  

 
 

  

--  
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Thank You. 

  

  

  

Best Regards 

  

James Lim  

(General Manager) 

Tel:+65 9242 3895 

  

 

UEN: 202218929Z 

BLK 1008 #01-24 Bukit Merah Lane 3, Singapore 159722 

Tel:+65 6275-6656, 6275-6566  

 
 

  

--  

  

  

  

  

Thank You. 
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Best Regards 

  

James Lim  

(General Manager) 

Tel:+65 9242 3895 

  

 

UEN: 202218929Z 

BLK 1008 #01-24 Bukit Merah Lane 3, Singapore 159722 

Tel:+65 6275-6656, 6275-6566  

 
 

  

--  

  

  

  

  

Thank You. 
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Best Regards 

  

James Lim  

(General Manager) 

Tel:+65 9242 3895 

  

 

UEN: 202218929Z 

BLK 1008 #01-24 Bukit Merah Lane 3, Singapore 159722 

Tel:+65 6275-6656, 6275-6566  

 
 

  

--  

  

  

  

  

Thank You. 
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Best Regards 

  

James Lim  

(General Manager) 

Tel:+65 9242 3895 

  

 

UEN: 202218929Z 

BLK 1008 #01-24 Bukit Merah Lane 3, Singapore 159722 

Tel:+65 6275-6656, 6275-6566  

 
 

  

--  

  

  

  

  

Thank You. 
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Best Regards 

  

James Lim  

(General Manager) 

Tel:+65 9242 3895 

  

 

UEN: 202218929Z 

BLK 1008 #01-24 Bukit Merah Lane 3, Singapore 159722 

Tel:+65 6275-6656, 6275-6566  

 
 
 
--  
 
 
 
 
Thank You. 
 
 
 
Best Regards 
 

James Lim  
(General Manager) 
Tel:+65 9242 3895 
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UEN: 202218929Z 
BLK 1008 #01-24 Bukit Merah Lane 3, Singapore 159722 
Tel:+65 6275-6656, 6275-6566  


