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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 15 September 2022 12:05 PM
To: 'Operation / Kristine'
Subject: RE: PENDING REVISED OFFER/S2M040C3_[TP REF:GBG9296T] _Accident Involving 

SHC8871P & GBG9296T_along_Bedok on 30/04/2022 14.30_PersonalAutoLine -- 
LOD

Attachments: DS FORM_GBG9296T.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We confirm settlement at $4,847.95(all-in). 
 
Please duly sign the document enclosed and return to us for our necessary action. 
 
Thank you. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Operation / Kristine <operation@tlauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 14 September 2022 2:16 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: PENDING REVISED OFFER/S2M040C3_[TP REF:GBG9296T] _Accident Involving SHC8871P & 
GBG9296T_along_Bedok on 30/04/2022 14.30_PersonalAutoLine -- LOD 
 
Reminder 
 
Without Prejudice, 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
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We refer to the matter below, and further to our email dated 09.09.2022. 
 
We note that to-date, we have yet to hear from you. 
 
Kindly expedite and revert to us with your revised offer as soon as possible. 
 
Your early reply is much appreciated. 
 
Thanks & regards, 
 

Kristine Goh 
 

 
Tong Luck Auto Pte Ltd 
160 Sin Ming Drive 
#07-01/06 Sin Ming Autocity 
Singapore 575722 
Tel: 6250 0088    Fax: 6250 5545 
Email: operation@tlauto.com.sg 
 
 

From: Operation / Kristine [mailto:operation@tlauto.com.sg]  
Sent: Friday, 9 September, 2022 10:38 AM 
To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: PENDING REVISED OFFER/S2M040C3_[TP REF:GBG9296T] _Accident Involving SHC8871P & 
GBG9296T_along_Bedok on 30/04/2022 14.30_PersonalAutoLine -- LOD 
 
Without Prejudice, 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
We refer to your email below, 
 
We would like to counter propose as follows:- 
 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST)               $4,440.50 

2. Loss of Use (5days x $80.00)      $  400.00   (Agreed) 

3. LTA/GIA Search Fee                       $       7.45   (Agreed) 

Total                                                           $4,847.95 

Kindly revert to us with your revised offer as soon as possible. 
 
Thanks & regards, 
 

Kristine Goh 
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Tong Luck Auto Pte Ltd 
160 Sin Ming Drive 
#07-01/06 Sin Ming Autocity 
Singapore 575722 
Tel: 6250 0088    Fax: 6250 5545 
Email: operation@tlauto.com.sg 
 
 
 
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Friday, 9 September, 2022 10:05 AM 
To: Operation / Kristine <operation@tlauto.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: PENDING OFFER/S2M040C3_[TP REF:GBG9296T] _Accident Involving SHC8871P & 
GBG9296T_along_Bedok on 30/04/2022 14.30_PersonalAutoLine -- LOD 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 

We have our principal instruction to offer as follows: - 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $  3,996.45 
2. Loss of Use (5days x $80.00) $     400.00 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $         7.45 

Total $ 4,403.90 

Please confirm acceptance. 

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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From: Operation / Kristine <operation@tlauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 8 September 2022 1:07 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: PENDING OFFER/S2M040C3_[TP REF:GBG9296T] _Accident Involving SHC8871P & 
GBG9296T_along_Bedok on 30/04/2022 14.30_PersonalAutoLine -- LOD 
 
Reminder 
 
Without Prejudice, 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
We refer to the matter below, and further to our email dated 02.09.2022. 
 
We note that to-date, we have yet to hear from you. 
 
Kindly expedite and revert to us with your offer as soon as possible. 
 
Your early reply is much appreciated. 
 
Thanks & regards, 
 

Kristine Goh 
 

 
Tong Luck Auto Pte Ltd 
160 Sin Ming Drive 
#07-01/06 Sin Ming Autocity 
Singapore 575722 
Tel: 6250 0088    Fax: 6250 5545 
Email: operation@tlauto.com.sg 
 
 
 
From: Operation / Candy Ong [mailto:operation@tlauto.com.sg]  
Sent: Friday, 2 September, 2022 4:24 PM 
To: 'Hsiao Tong' <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: S2M040C3_[TP REF:GBG9296T] _Accident Involving SHC8871P & GBG9296T_along_Bedok on 30/04/2022 
14.30_PersonalAutoLine -- LOD 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Please find attached as per your request 
 
Kindly revert ASAP. 
 
Best Regards, 
Candy Ong  
Tong Luck Auto Pte Ltd 
 
 
From: Operation / Candy Ong [mailto:operation@tlauto.com.sg]  
Sent: Monday, June 27, 2022 4:20 PM 
To: 'motor.survey@axa.com.sg' <motor.survey@axa.com.sg> 
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Cc: 'filenet-ctom-p-sg' <filenet-ctom-p-sg@axa.com.hk> 
Subject: RE: S2M040C3_[TP REF:GBG9296T] _Accident Involving SHC8871P & GBG9296T_along_Bedok on 30/04/2022 
14.30_PersonalAutoLine -- LOD 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
The above mentioned vehicle had completed the repairs and to our client’s satisfaction 
 
Please find attached LOD and relevant documents for your kind attention and necessary action  
 
The original copy will mail out to you by today  
 
Kindly let us have your offer at an earlier date . 
 
Thanks & regards, 
Candy Ong  

 
Tong Luck Auto Pte Ltd 
160 Sin Ming Drive 
#07-01/06 Sin Ming Autocity 
Singapore 575722 
Tel: 6250 0088 Fax: 6250 5545 
Email: operation@tlauto.com.sg 
 
 
 


