Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Brian <brian.eng@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 14 December 2022 10:35 AM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Steve Chen (LKK Auto)
Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: YQ 3538 - supplementary item

Dear Veron,

Ok, finalise the amount L/S $57800 before excess $2000 accepted.

Thanks and Best Regards

Brian Eng

MOVA Automotive Pte Ltd
H/P : +65 8717 3377
Fax : +656264 3151

Auvlomative Ple Ltd

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 14 December 2022 10:28 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto); Brian

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: YQ 3538 - supplementary item

Dear Brian,
As spoken.

Lump Sum $57,800/- before excess $2000 @ 15 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 25 November 2022 9:39 AM

To: Brian <brian.eng@mova.com.sg>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@|kkauto.com>
Subject: YQ 3538 - supplementary item

Hi Brian/Veron,



Kindly refer supplementary marking. The front bumper and fog lamp is old damaged.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@I|kkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Brian <brian.eng@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 24 November 2022 6:54 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: YQ 3538 - supplementary item

Hi Steve,
Kindly refer to the attached supplementary items.

Thanks and Best Regards

Brian Eng

MOVA Automotive Pte Ltd
H/P : +65 8717 3377
Fax : +656264 3151

@MOVA

Auvlomative Ple Ltd

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) [mailto:SteveChen@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 24 November 2022 8:32 AM

To: Brian

Subject: YQ 3538 - Resurvey

Hi Brian,

FYI.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@I|kkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
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