Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: frontdesk@tImotor.com.sg

Sent: Thursday, 15 June 2023 12:43 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: SJL 81J-C10015688 /CD- DOA: 04/06/2022

Thank you, Huey Yon.

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, June 15, 2023 11:26 AM

To: frontdesk@tImotor.com.sg

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SJL 81J-C10015688 /CD- DOA: 04/06/2022

Dear Patricia,
Please submit your LOD with lump sum $1,800.00 and 2 repair days to AUTO & GENERAL insurance company.

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: frontdesk@tlmotor.com.sg <frontdesk@tImotor.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, June 14, 2023 8:35 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SJL 81J-C10015688 /CD- DOA: 04/06/2022

This is your recommendation, why need to subject approval?

Regards,
Patricia Tan

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, June 14, 2023 11:20 AM

To: frontdesk@tlmotor.com.sg

Subject: RE: SJL 81J-C10015688 /CD- DOA: 04/06/2022

Dear Patricia,
Re-send

Without prejudice

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair at Lump sum $1,800.00 with 2 days of repair, subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,
Huey Yon | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants



phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: frontdesk@tlmotor.com.sg <frontdesk@tlmotor.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, June 14, 2023 10:30 AM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SJL 81J-C10015688 /CD- DOA: 04/06/2022

Dear Huey Yon,
Our calculation is $1800.00, if your end adjusted the sensor to $300SN.
Await for your reply.

Rdgs,
Patricia Tan

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, June 14, 2023 8:18 AM

To: frontdesk@tImotor.com.sg

Subject: SJL 81J-C10015688 /CD- DOA: 04/06/2022

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Without prejudice

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of Lump sum $1,700.00 with 2 days of repair, subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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