Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Bernard Kee <bernard@ecare.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 1 September 2022 1:33 PM
To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: VEHICLE NO. SMS 9822G

Dear Celine

We confirmed the COR $2,250.00 @ 4Days

Thank you

Bersind Kee

Mobile (65) 97478383

51, Ubi Ave 1,

#01-29 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933.

Tel: (65) 68418892

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) [mailto:celinefong@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 31 August 2022 7:29 pm

To: bernard@ecare.com.sg

Cc: SUR

Subject: VEHICLE NO. SMS 9822G

Dear Bernard,

Kindly refer to our finalise $2,250.00 ; 4 days.

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



