Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 27 July 2022 16:19

To: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com

Cc: Admin A

Subject: [REJECTION] RE: S2M0O43EW - [EXTERNAL] PRI For SLV5091X /DOA 05/06/2022

INVOLVED WITH SHC394C ALONG Penang Rd *** LKK REF : CC4/ASM22005432/Kea3

Attachments: VIDEO SCREENSHOT.pdf

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sir,
We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed a copy of our insured video footage screenshot for your easy reference.

Our principal has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client have encroached
into our insured path.

We are of the opinion that liability is not in your client’s favor.

Under such a circumstances, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and
unable to look into your client’s claim.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 25 July 2022 18:36

To: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: S2MO043EW - [EXTERNAL] PRI For SLV5091X /DOA 05/06/2022 INVOLVED WITH SHC394C ALONG Penang Rd ***
LKK REF : CC4/ASM22005432/Kea3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI's sketch plan and statement.



Sketch Plan

A-SHC 3K C
g - SLVEVAUX

Describe Circumstances of the Accident

ON 05.06.2022 AT ABOUT 0245HRS | WAS DRIVING MY VEHICLE A
SHC394C ON THE 2ND LANE OF PENANG ROAD. VEHICLE B SLV5091X
ON MY LEFT, SIDE SWIPE HIS VEHICLE B RIGHT FRONT ONTO MY
VEHICLE A LEFT REAR. | HURT MY NECK, SHOULDER AND LOWER BACK
AFTER IMPACT. PARTICULARS EXCHANGED.

| WAS GIVEN A 2 DAYS MC.

Please provide us the following.
e evidence i.e. video and scene photo
e Police investigation result (if any)

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Asher.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com

Sent: Tuesday, 7 June 2022 4:39 PM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey

Subject: SZMO43EW - [EXTERNAL] PRI For SLV5091X /DOA 05/06/2022 INVOL
SHC394C ALONG Penang Rd

Attachments: GIA report.pdf

Categories: Akash

Dear Sirs,

We have been autherised by U-RENTAL PTE LTD, the registered owner of motor vehicle SLV 5091 X at the material time of accident to make
insured.

Please give us the list of panel of your survey firms for our selection to inspect the above said vehicle or you may
from either one of the 3 survey firms,

1) Premier Appraiser Servi

2) LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

3) AJAX Inspection Services Pie Ltd

Please advise us with your assigned surveyor, name and contact number for this matter.

Kindly contact us at claim.autoworxhouse @gmail.com or call §4528211 before coming to ensure the vehicle is |

Thank you.
Best regards,

Admin team

Autoworx House

No.176 Sin Ming Drive

#02-01 Singapore 575721

Email: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com
Tel: 64528211

Fax: 64517423




