Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 24 June 2022 5:00 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Vehicle SLT9984D (Nissan Nv350) and SLL8281Y (INDIA INSURED
) ON 06/06/2022 *** | KK REF: CC6/GRB22005413/ga3

Attachments: SLT9984D REPAIR BILL AND LOA.pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We submit our claim as follow :

Repair Cost S$ 3852.00

Loss of use SS 1200.00 @S$400.00 per day
Total SS 5052.00

Please reply your offer to settle.

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 13 June 2022 2:30 PM

To: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Cc: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Vehicle SLT9984D (Nissan Nv350) and SLL8281Y (INDIA INSURED ) ON 06/06/2022 ***
LKK REF: CC6/GRB22005413/ga3

Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI’s sketch plan and statement.



