Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Lee <cecilia.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 6 June 2022 2:40 PM

To: Roger Lim; assignments@lkkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI; Tan Kah Leong

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM22D203775/C02/SJH8463J/LEEPG & YOUR REF: FBL1037B TO
CONDUCT PRS

Attachments: Boost_est cost of repairs_Burgman (3).pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam

Thank you for your email.
We will appoint LKK as SJE.
Dear LKK

Please arrange Mr. Marcus Chua to conduct PRS on without prejudice basis.

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to be
expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,
Cecilia Lee
Senior Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6530 | F: (65) 6224 7175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: & F-iilf Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Roger Lim <boostautomotive.sg@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 6 June 2022 12:24 pm

To: Tan Kah Leong <KahLeong.Tan@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Cecilia Lee <cecilia.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: Re: OUR REF: SNM22D203775/C02/SJH8463)/LEEPG & YOUR REF: FBL1037B TO CONDUCT PRS

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.



Hi Kah Leong,

Good afternoon.

We are agreeable with the list of surveyors.

Please find estimated cost of repairs attached in this email.
When will pre repair inspection survey be carried out?

Thank you.

Best regards,
Roger Lim

on behalf on Boost Automotive Pte Ltd

On Mon, 6 Jun 2022, 12:08 Tan Kah Leong, <KahLeong.Tan@sg.cntaiping. com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Roger,

We refer to your email below.

Please see attached and let us know if you agree with SJE.

Thank you.

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid—19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy
documents to us as delay is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents. All
correspondence should be made via email claimsdept@sg.cntaiping. com or fax at 6224

7175. . Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Regards

Tan Kah Leong



Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: (65) 6389 6193 | F: (65) 6224 7175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please
notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg. cntaiping. com>

Sent: Monday, June 6, 2022 11:39 AM

To: Tan Kah Leong <KahLeong. Tan@sg. cntaiping. com>; Cecilia Lee
{cecilia. lee@sg. cntaiping. com>;  boostautomotive. sg@gmail. com’

<boostautomotive. sg@gmail. com>

Subject: OUR REF: SNM22D203775/C02/SJH8463]/LEEPG & YOUR REF: FBL1037B TO CONDUCT PRS

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

via EMAIL ONLY

Dear Kah Leong,

Please refer to the below email.

Kindly assist to conduct PRS FBL1037B soonest possible on behalf of Cecilia Lee.



Please contact our claims department Cecilia Lee 6389 6530 the officer in charge.

*Kindly quote our claim reference number when replying.*

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to be
expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. . Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Thank you

Angie Foo

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: (65) 63896116 | F: (65) 62247175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: X¥¥filg Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain
confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-
mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Roger Lim <boostautomotive. sg@gmail. com>
Sent: Friday, June 3, 2022 4:40 PM




To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg. cntaiping. com>

Subject: Request for Pre Repair Inspection Survey

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Sir/Mdm,
Good afternoon.

We would like to request for your Surveyor to contact Mr Roger of Boost Automotive Pte
Ltd at HP: 93628159 for a pre-repair survey of our client’s vehicle FBL1037B located at
Suzuki Motorcycles Singapore, 9 Kaki Bukit Road 1, #01-01 Eunos Technolink, Singapore
415938.

Insured Vehicle with China Taiping Insurance: SJH8463]

Date of Accident: May 28, 2022.

The estimated cost of repairs and GIA report are attached in this email.
Thank you.

Best regards,

Boost Automotive Pte Ltd

6 Yishun Industrial Street 1

#05-20 North View Bizhub



Singapore 768090

HP: 9362 8159

Email: boostautomotive. sg@gmail. com




