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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com>
Sent: Saturday, 8 April 2023 12:45 PM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR; CS A Team
Subject: Re: GBC6198J Estimate and Final Pictures

Dear Veron and Taufikh, please proceed to close this case. 
 
Thank you and best regards 
Yi Xin 
 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 
T: 63340858  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

 
 
On Fri, Apr 7, 2023 at 8:30 PM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Yi Xin, 

  

  

“Without Prejudice” 

  

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $4150/- with 5 days of repair, subject to their 
approval.  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, October 7, 2022 1:10 PM 
To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: GBC6198J Estimate and Final Pictures 

  

  

From: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, 7 October 2022 1:09:52 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: GBC6198J Estimate and Final Pictures 

Dear Taufikh, please help for GBC6198J finalise, thank you.  

  

Best Regards 

Yi Xin 
 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 
T: 63340858  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

  

  

On Fri, Jun 17, 2022 at 2:14 PM Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Taufikh, please help me for GBC6198J finalise as soon as possible, thank you.  

  

Best Regards 

YI Xin 
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Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 
T: 63340858  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

  

  

On Sat, Jun 11, 2022 at 7:17 PM Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Taufikh  

  

Good evening, please refer to GBC6198J final pictures and estimate for you to mark, thanks alot. 

  

Best Regards 

Yi Xin 
 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 
T: 63340858  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 


