Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 5 August 2022 10:03 AM
To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fw: SLH 3311)

Hi Huey Yon,

this case finalised

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

=] Save the Larth- FPrint only when rnecessary-

From: Hup Ley Huat <hup.ley.huat@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 4 August 2022 11:45 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SLH 3311)

Thank you please proceed with acceptance

On Thu, 4 Aug 2022 at 11:22 AM, Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Aloy,

Refer to attachment

Apologise for the mistake,

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of L/S $1,650.00/- with 03 days of repair,
subject to their approval

Kindly acknowledge

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
Save the Larth- FPrint only when necessary-



From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 4 August 2022 11:07 am

To: Hup.ley.huat@gmail.com <Hup.ley.huat@gmail.com>
Subject: SLH 3311)J

Hi Aloy,
Refer to attachment

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of L/S $1,85000.00/- with 03 days of repair,
subject to their approval

Kindly acknowledge

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
Save the Larth- FPrint only when necessary-



