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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: oscar@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg

Sent: Thursday, 4 May 2023 9:54 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto); 'Lin Shu Juan'; raymond@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SJR7311T-FINALISE

Hi Rasul, 

 

We confirm total $10,560.50 before GST. 

 

Thank you 

 

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Thursday, May 4, 2023 9:41 AM 

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>; oscar@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg 

Subject: Re: OD CLAIM FOR SJR7311T-FINALISE 

 

Hi Oscar, 

 

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $10,560.50. /- with 12 days of 

repair before GST, subject to their approval. 

 

 

Best Regards,  

Rasul | Assessor  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct  
file and location.

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  

 

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, 18 April 2023 2:32 pm 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: OD CLAIM FOR SJR7311T-FINALISE  
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Hi Rasul, 

  

Kindly assist-by this week. 

  
Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Saturday, October 8, 2022 9:16 AM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: OD CLAIM FOR SJR7311T-FINALISE 

  

  

From: oscar@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg <oscar@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg> 

Sent: Saturday, 8 October 2022 9:16:06 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: raymond@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg <raymond@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>; 
shujuan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg <shujuan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>; 

kenho@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg <kenho@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SJR7311T-FINALISE 

Hi Rasul, 

  

Good morning 

Kindly refer to the attached  

  

Thank you 

  

From: oscar@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg <oscar@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 5 October 2022 2:41 pm 

To: 'Rasul (LKKAuto)' <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'raymond@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg' <raymond@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>; 

'shujuan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg' <shujuan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>; 

'kenho@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg' <kenho@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SJR7311T-FINALISE 

  

Hi Rasul, 

  

Good morning 

Any updates? 

  

Thank you 

  

From: oscar@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg <oscar@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 14 July 2022 9:31 am 

To: 'Rasul (LKKAuto)' <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'raymond@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg' <raymond@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>; 

'shujuan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg' <shujuan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>; 

'kenho@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg' <kenho@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg> 

Subject: OD CLAIM FOR SJR7311T-FINALISE 

  

Hi Rasul, 
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Good morning 

Kindly refer to the attach for the after paint photo & revise estimate with include Sub  

  

Thing to take note: 

  

• Front Reinforcement- $150, not $160 

• Front Bumper Arm RH - $110, not $100 

• Front undercarriage Cover RH - $70, not $60 

  

  

  

Oscar Pong 

Automotive Repair Centre Pte Ltd  

38 Woodlands Industrial Park E1 

#05-18  

Singapore 757700 

Tel: +65 6468 8834 

Fax: +65 6462 2278 

HP: +65 92279933 

  


