Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Shiau Chan,

Claims Department <claims@ignitemotors.io>

Saturday, 19 November 2022 1:20 AM

Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

assessment@ignitemotors.io; admin@ignitemotors.io; SUR
Re: CHINA-TP SFL 1286B DOA: 02/06/22

We accept the finalized amount of -LS $11800/-12DAYS of repair for Vehicle number: SFL 1286 B .
We will follow up with the LOD shortly.

Thank you!

Regards,
Jo

IGNITE MOTORS PTE. LTD.

The contents of this document apply to vehicle damages only. All personal injuries and damages arising therefrom
are excluded from the ambit and application of this document.

On Wed, 9 Nov 2022 at 15:24, Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@l|kkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir/Madam,

Amy updates?

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 27 October 2022 2:29 PM




To: assessment@ignitemotors.io; claims@ignitemotors.io; admin@ignitemotors.io
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: CHINA-TP SFL 1286B DOA: 02/06/22

Dear Sir/Madam,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair $11,800.00 and 12 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims Dept <claims rar@bifrostauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 26 October 2022 6:47 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: CHINA-TP SFL 1286B DOA: 02/06/22

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Shiau Chan,

Please bring the amount and days to Ignite Motor's email and the team from Ignite Motors will finalise with you
through the email.

Thank you!



The contents of this document apply to vehicle damages only. All personal injuries and damages arising therefrom
are excluded from the ambit and application of this document.

Best Regards,
Mavic
Motor Claims Department

BIFROST AUTO PTE. LTD

On Thu, 20 Oct 2022 at 14:32, Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Mavic,

How about the repair cost Lum Sum $11,800.00?

Best Regards,
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims Dept <claims_rar@bifrostauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 19 October 2022 11:49 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: Re: CHINA-TP SFL 1286B DOA: 02/06/22

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear Shiau Chan,

Kindly note that SFL1286B is from Ignite Motors Pte Ltd as shown in the attachment's header. Please bring this
case to Ignite Motors Pte Ltd. Thank you

The contents of this document apply to vehicle damages only. All personal injuries and damages arising therefrom
are excluded from the ambit and application of this document.

Best Regards,
Mavic
Motor Claims Department

BIFROST AUTO PTE. LTD

On Wed, 19 Oct 2022 at 14:23, Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Dennis,

Re-send

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair $11,800.00 and 12 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Kindly check and advise which workshop name for insurance payment purpose.

Best Regards,
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 7 September 2022 5:27 PM

To: assessment_ral@bifrostauto.com

Cc: claims_rar@bifrostauto.com; Claims Dept <claims_Its@bifrostauto.com>; Ms Lim

<claims Itm@bifrostauto.com>; Assessment Dept <assessment ltc@bifrostauto.com>; SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>
Subject: CHINA-TP SFL 1286B DOA: 02/06/22

Dear Dennis,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair $11,800.00 and 12 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Kindly check and advise which workshop name for insurance payment purpose.

Best Regards,
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



